
MINUTES OF REGULAR MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF
THE CITY OF LUFKIN, TEXAS, HELD ON THE

4TH DAY OF FEBRUARY, 1997AT 5:00 P. M

.

On the 4th day of February, 1997 the City Council of the City of Lufkin, Texas,
convenedin a regular meeting in the Council Chambersof City Hall with the
following membersthereof, to wit:

Louis Bronaugh Mayor
Don Boyd Mayor pro tem
Betty Jones Councilmember,Ward No. 3
Bob Bowman Councilmember,Ward No. 4
JackGorden,Jr. Councilmember,Ward No. 5
Tucker Weems Councilmember,Ward No. 6
C. G. Maclin City Manager
Darryl Mayfield Asst. City Manager/Finance
StephenAbraham City Planner
Bob Flournoy City Attorney
Nellie Matthews Administrative Secretary
Keith Wright City Engineer
Kenneth R. Williams Public Works Director

beingpresent,and

Percy Simond Councilmember,Ward No. 1
Atha Stokes City Secretary

beingabsentwhenthe following businesswastransacted.

1. Meetingwas openedwith prayer by Kevin Roy, EducationalMinister, Denman
Avenue Baptist Church.

2. Mayor Bronaugh welcomedvisitors present.

3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES

Motion wasmadeby Councilmember Don Boyd and secondedby Councilmember
JackGorden,Jr. that the minutesof the Regular Meetingof January21, 1997be
approvedaspresented. A unanimousaffirmative vote wasrecorded.

4. USED VEHICLE DONATION - APPROVED - LONE STAR BOOT CAMP - LISD

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas donating a used
vehicle to the Lone Star Boot Camp.

City Manager Maclin statedthat after discussionat a previousmeeting, Council
requestedthat the City Attorney determinethe legality of the donation. City
ManagerMaclin statedthat Mr. Flournoy is able to confirm that this donation is
acceptablewithin regulationsof governmentalentities. City Manager Maclin
statedthat the City had previously arrangeda cashlessexchangeof serviceswith
Angelina County where they would provide prisonersto work at the Recycling
Center from the County jail, in return the City would pay approximately$20,000a
year for a deputy to bring the prisoners,provide supervision,and then take the
prisonersback in the evening. City ManagerMaclin statedthat a year and a half
ago the City enteredinto an arrangementwith the County whereby the Deputy
Sheriff would bring prisonersto the RecyclingCenterand the City would provide an
animal control officer who would make calls out in the County to pick up rabid
animals, and meet animalcontrol requestsin the County. City Manager Mactin
statedthat since then the City hasbeenoperating under a cashlessexchangeof
serviceswhereby theyprovide a servicewe needandwe provide a servicethat they
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needandthereareno dollarschanginghandsper se.

City Manager Maclin stated that the suggestion was made that there are
arrangementsthat the City haswith LISD in termsof servicesrenderedand feesthat
arepaid that perhapsthe City could exchangea usedvehicle for the Lone Star Boot
Camp Program for some services that the City utilizes through LISD. City
ManagerMaclin statedthat basically this requestis beingbrought back to Council
today to seekpermissionin this request,and if Council concurs,he will meetwith
Dr. Sharpand Mr. Giles tomorrow to discussthis matter.

Motion wasmadeby CouncilmemberDon Boyd andsecondedby Councilmember
Betty Jones that the City Managerbe authorizedto enter into a discussionwith
LISD for exchangeof servicesin considerationof a usedvehicle. A unanimous
affirmative vote was recorded.

5. ORDINANCE - APPROVED - FIRST READING - ZONE CHANGE

-

RESIDENTIAL LARGE SINGLE FAMILY TO LOCAL BUSINESS - 724
SOUTHWOOD DRIVE - JO ANN PETREE

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas the requestof Jo
Ann Petreeto changethe zoningfrom “RL” ResidentialLarge SingleFamily to “LB”
Local Businesson property locatedat 724 SouthwoodDrive.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat included in the Council packet is an explanation
from the PlanningDepartmentregardingthis request,the backgroundinformation
relating to zoning in this area,and a recommendationfrom the Planning& Zoning
Commissionby unanimousvote to deny the zonechangerequestbasedon input
they received at the Planning & Zoning Commission meeting and the
ComprehensivePlan.

City Manager Maclin stated that in order to overturn the unanimous denial
recommendationof P & Z, it would takesix affirmative votesby the Council.

Jo Ann Petreestatedthat the residentshave a good point in that it is their home
area, but this is also herhome area. Mrs. Petreestatedthat thehomesheboughtin
this areaneededa lot of repair. Mrs. Petreestatedthat her property is adjacentto
the Commercial area and although it is not zoned in a couple of places for
ResidentialLarge or Commercial,it is a Commercialareaand will most likely not
be a residentialarea in that oneblock. Mrs. Petreestatedthat if there wasn’t
alreadyCommercialproperty establishedand she lived in this beautiful area,she
would be againstany zone change. Mrs. Petreestated that, however, it (the
Commercialzoning) is there, and is going to be there,and she is there, and she
would like for it to be as nice as possible. Mrs. Petreestatedthat the only way
possible to encouragenew growth and improvementson these propertiesis to
changethe zone. Mrs. Petreestatedthat the reasonsheis requestinga zonechange
is to allow her sign to remain and so that other peoplewill be encouragedto
improve the properties on both sides of her. Mrs. Petreestated that the
Commercialpropertiesadjoining her propertyand aroundher arevery clean, and
very neat. Mrs. Petreestatedthat the propertynext to hers is an old gray housein
deplorablecondition with rats and rodentsin the overgrowth. Mrs. Petreestated
that therearedogsand goats tied in thebackyard of this house. Mrs. Petreestated
that the propertyownerscannotafford to put any moneyinto their propertyunless
they can do something with it. Mrs. Petreestated that the area residents
desperatelyneeda zonechangeto keepthis problem from encroachingfurther into
the moreexpensiveresidentialhome areas. Mrs. Petreestatedthat “sticking our
headsin the sands” and refusing to face the problem will only encouragethe
problemto grow. Mrs. Petreestatedthat shehaslived in Lufkin for 14 yearsand
had just bought the propertysheis seekingto be rezoneda yearago. Mrs. Petree
statedthat shehad talked to the gentlemanwho owns the propertywhere the old
gray houseis locatedand understandswhy he hasnot doneanything. Mrs. Petree
statedthat becausethis areais zonedCommercial,no potentialbuyer is going to buy
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propertyfor a residencein this areaor build a homein this area,unlessthey canalso
run a little businessandhavea sign advertisingthebusiness. Mrs. Petreestatedthat
after this gentlemanexplainedthe problemshe had with the property shenow
understandswhy he cannotimprove the property. Mrs. Petreestatedthat, in her
opinion, the smaller home owners would improve their propertiesif the zoning
waschanged,becauseat a later datethey could get their moneyout of it. Mrs.
Petreestatedthat shewishedthat thosepeoplewho passedher propertyand looked
out their windows and objectedto this requestwould stop and taketime to find out
what is really goingon.

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat he agreedwith Mrs. Petreethat the old gray houseis an
embarrassmentto the residentsof the Southwood/Bynumarea.

In responseto a questionby CouncilmemberGorden,Mrs. Petreestatedthat the way
sheunderstandsthe zoning, the propertyon onesideof her is all commercialand is
ownedby JohnSlaughter. Mrs. Petreestatedthat thepropertyto the right of her is
the gray two-story house,which hasa greatdealof property with the house. Mrs.
Petreestatedthat the samepersonwho owns the grayhousealso owns somerental
propertyfurther up the street. Mrs. Petreestatedthat the Commercialpropertyis in
neat,cleanconditionin this area,it is theresidentialpropertythat is rundown.

In responseto a questionby Mayor Bronaugh,Mrs. Petreestatedthat shehad called
the City and complainedaboutsomepigs behind the old gray house. Mrs. Petree
statedthat thepigs were removedbut thedogsandgoatswere allowedto remain.

In responseto a questionby Mayor Bronaugh,Mr. Abrahamstatedhe is not aware
of any official complaintsbut has takennote that thereare dogs and goats in the
yard. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat he would have someonecheck into this situation
tomorrowmorning.

In responseto a questionby CouncilmemberGordenthat the adjacentproperty is
zoned“Apartments”, Mr. Abraham statedthat the property is zonedResidental,
and apologized that the map was hard to read. Mr. Abraham stated that
immediatelynorth of Mrs. Petree’sproperty the property is zoned“Neighborhood
Retail”, and north of that is “Central Business”. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat Mrs.
Petree’sproperty is zoned“ResidentialLarge”. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat anytime
you have Commercial zoning it will eventually be located next to anotherzone,
which is the issue that was consideredby the Planning & Zoning Commission.
Mr. Abrahamstatedthat arearesidentsaskedif the Commercialzone is extended
further south,wherewill it stop.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat the Planning & Zoning Commission in the last
four monthsrequestedthat staff do a reviewof this entire areatriggeredby a request
on Pershing Avenue just down from Slaughter& Sons. City Manager Maclin
statedthat as a result of the review there were some modifications made in the
ComprehensivePlan that was forwarded to City Council on Pershing. City
Manager Maclin statedthat on page 3 and 4 of the minutes of the Planning &
Zoning Commissionare the commentsfrom GeorgeWatts,JuleFenley,Dr. Barnett,
Carlotta Hunt and Charles Evans as residents in the area stating what their
oppositionis. City ManagerMacun statedthat basically, the oppositionis the fear
of where does the encroachmentstop into what they feel is a residential
neighborhoodand is zonedResidential,versusthe intersectionof Southwoodand
Pershingwhich basicallyhassomecommercialactivity.

CouncilmemberGordenstatedthat he sympathizedwith Mrs. Petreebut did not feel
that zoning the property Commercial would fix the problem. Councilmember
Gordenstatedthat if thereis somethingthe City cando to addressthis problem, in
his opinion, they should.

Mr. Abraham statedthat staff will certainly look at this situation from a Code
Enforcementstandpointand will addressthe problem with goats and pigs. Mr.
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Abrahamstatedthat it will not changethe upkeepof the structureby changingthe
zoning.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberGorden,Mr. Abrahamstatedthat there
aretwo issuesto be considered: (1) in orderto havea sign thepropertywould have
to be zonedto a non-residentialzoning classification. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat
severalyearsago the PlanningDepartmentwent through the processof amending
the Customary Home Occupation to allow them in Residential Large zoning
districts. Mr. Abraham stated that under the Customary Home Occupation
designation,you cannothavea sign, andyou cannothaveoutsideemployees. Mr.
Abrahamstatedthat the operation is limited to only thosepeoplewho live in the
house. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat there is a list of six restrictionsfor a Customary
Home Occupation. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat Mrs. Petreewould not be allowed to
have a sign if shegoeswith the CustomaryHome Occupationdesignationand must
adhereto the other five restrictions,which would be monitored. Mr. Abraham
statedthat this type of businessis complaint-drivenand if he receivesa call that
there are 50 cars in the driveway, that violates the CustomaryHome Occupation
designation.

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat severalmonths ago a personwas allowed to put in a
beautyshopon Pershing,which is in the samegeneralarea. City ManagerMaclin
stated that in this particular case, the Planning & Zoning Commission
recommendedrevisionof the ComprehensivePlan,and in this case,they havenot.
Mayor Bronaugh statedthat thereare some apartmentson Pershing,which were
skipped over to allow for the beauty shop zoned as Local Business. Mayor
Bronaughstatedthat, in his opinion, it would be improving the areato rezoneit
Commercial rather than hurting it. Mr. Abraham stated that from the staff
standpoint,staff originally recommendeddenial of the zonechangebecauseit was
in conflict with the ComprehensivePlan. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat an Apartment
is a residential use,therefore,short of amendingthe areato reflect that the future
useof this entire areashouldbe Commercial,PlanningDepartmentrecommended
denial. Mr. Abraham statedthat the Planning & Zoning Commissionrequested
that staff look at amendingthe ComprehensivePlan. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat after
reviewing the ComprehensivePlan, the Planning Department gave the P&Z
Commissionthree options and they choseone of those options. Mr. Abraham
statedthat becausethe ComprehensivePlan statedthat this and all otherproperties
in that area should receive a non-residentialzoning classification, they then
recommendedthat it be changedto NeighborhoodRetail. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat
the discussionrevolvedaround the fact that they would not be approving a beauty
shop but all the usesthat are allowed in a NeighborhoodRetail zoning district.
Mr. Abraham statedthat it is quite ironic that just last week the personwho was
going to put in the beautyshop called and askedwhat elsecould go in, since they
maynot be putting in a beautyshopafterall.

In responseto a questionby Mayor Bronaugh,Mr. Abrahamstatedthat he had no
knowledgeas to whether the building on the south side of Mrs. Petreehad ever
beenusedasa multiple dwelling.

In responseto a questionby CouncilmemberBowman, Mr. Abrahamstatedthat all
of the residentswho protestedthis zone changerequestlived south of CampStreet.
Mr. Abrahamstatedthat the attorney who owns the propertynext to Mrs. Petreeis
oneof the residentswho is in favor of the zonechange. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat
oneof the options to be offeredto the Planning & Zoning Commissioncould be to
changethe ComprehensivePlan on the property that is non-residential. Mr.
Abraham statedthat the PlanningDepartmenttries to find a legitimate breaking
point suchas a street. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat of primary concernhereis what
leveragedoesthis give the people acrossthe street. In responseto a questionby
CouncilmemberJonesasto wherethenextbreakingpoint suchas a streetwould be,
Mr. Abrahamstatedthat it could beParkLane.

Mayor Bronaughpointed out that thereis a car washnext to Mrs. Petree’sproperty
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anda restaurantthat hasbeenvacantfor someyearsis locatedacrossthe streetfrom
her property. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat a year ago the propertyacrossthe street
was rezoned for a dentist’s office, which has never beenbuilt to level out the
distancesouthof Pershing.

In responseto a questionby Mayor Bronaugh,Mr. Abraham statedthat, in his
opinion, it would be appropriatefor Council to go aheadand vote on this issueand
ask staff to take further considerationof the ComprehensivePlan. Mr. Abraham
statedthat this would not be considered“spotzoning”.

In responseto a questionby CouncilmemberGorden,Mr. Abraham statedthat a
zoningchangewill not changethe appearanceof property. Mr. Abrahamstated
that zoning is a very poor tool to upgradethe appearanceof a property; appearance
is a separateissue.

In responseto a questionby Mayor Bronaugh,Mr. Abrahamstatedthat the request
is for a weddingchapelwhich requiresa Local Businesszoningclassification.

Mrs. Petreestatedthat shedid not understanda lot of what was going on, but she
did know that not allowing any type of zonechangein the last 13 years hasnot
improved the property.

Motion was madeby CouncilmemberBob Bowman to table this requestuntil the
ComprehensivePlan could be reviewedfurther. City ManagerMaclin statedthat
there has already been a review of the ComprehensivePlan in this area.
CouncilmemberGordenstatedthat he was inclined to agreewith Mrs. Petreein that
if changingthe zoning would help the situation,it should be done. Mr. Abraham
statedthat, in his opinion, changingthe zoning on Mrs. Petree’spropertywould not
require an amendmentto the ComprehensivePlan at this time. Mr. Abraham
statedthat staff could sendthe ComprehensivePlan to the Planning & Zoning
Commissionto look at one more time to see if ultimately staff should extend the
non-residentialclassificationdown to Camp Street,or how far south we want to
extendit. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat he would be hesitant to saythat the zoning
should be changed any further on Southwood without a change to the
ComprehensivePlan becausethis is directly adjacentto a piece of property that the
ComprehensivePlan saysshould go Commercial,therefore,thereis a little latitude.
Mr. Abrahamstatedthat, in his opinion, this is as far south aswe shouldgo unless
there is the will to change the ComprehensivePlan and apply it evenly to
everybody. Mr. Abrahamstatedthat it shouldbe determinedif Camp Streetis a
non-residential street, becausewhen the property is changed to Commercial,
everybodythat owns property therecan subdivide the property and start putting
non-residentialuses,and whether is Camp Street really a non-residentialstreet
mustbe considered.

Motion was made by Councilmember Jack Gorden, Jr. and seconded by
CouncilmemberBob Bowman that the zonechangeas requestedby Jo Ann Petree
from “RL” Residential Large Single Family to “LB” Local Businesson property
locatedat 724 SouthwoodDrive be approvedon First Readingas presented. A
unanimousaffirmative vote wasrecorded.

6. AMENDMENT - APPROVED - ZONING ORDINANCE - FIRST READING

-

‘PUD’ PLANNED UNIT DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas an Amendmentto
the Zoning Ordinance(Ordinance 1146) as it relates to the “PUD” PlannedUnit
DevelopmentDistrict.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat includedin the packet is a memorandumfrom the
Planning Department with an explanation and a unanimous recommendation
from the Planning & Zoning Commission to amend the Planned Unit
DevelopmentDistrict. City ManagerMaclin statedthat basicallythe City Planning
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Departmenthasworked diligently to explore ways to improve our PlannedUnit
DevelopmentDistrict so that it gives more flexibility to the Planning & Zoning
Commissionand the PlanningDepartmentstaff as they work with developersso
that they canhopefully producewin/win situations. City ManagerMaclin stated
that this will allow developersto do some things that they would like to do
differently that can’t be done without a PlannedUnit Development,while at the
sametime providing somemeasuresto satisfy adjacentresidents. City Manager
Maclin stated that you can put more restrictive items within a Planned Unit
Development than you can in a blanket Commercial, Local Business or
NeighborhoodRetail. City ManagerMaclin statedthat staff believesthat this will
be a tool that the PlanningDepartment,Planning & Zoning Commission, and City
Council will find asbeinga very helpful tool in creatinga way to producewin/win
situations in neighborhoodsacrossLufkin. City ManagerMaclin statedthat this
has been given to the developmentcommunity and the engineeringcommunity
prior to taking it to the Planning & Zoning Commissionto seektheir feedbackand
comments,and the feedbackhasbeenfavorable.

In responseto a questionby CouncilmemberWeems,City Manager Maclin stated
that in somecasesthis will minimize someproblemssuchaswasthe casewith Mrs.
Petreetonight in that it gives the PlanningDepartmentstaff the ability to work with
the developer to create situations that are acceptableto neighboring residents
throughbuffer zonesand landscapingrequirements,and otherstipulations,while a
developerstill gets to utilize more definitive plans in terms of not having to use
everything within a zoning district but actually pull out single items within a
zoningdistrict, which you cannotdo without the PUD.

In responseto a questionby CouncilmemberJones,Mr. Abrahampresenteda plat of
Brookhollow as an example of a PlannedUnit Developmentand gave a brief
descriptionof how the PUD would work.

In responseto a questionby Mayor Bronaugh,Mr. Abrahamstatedthat therewould
not be a problem if the developersof Card Forestwantedto comebackwith some
changesto their developmentas long as the Planning & Zoning Commissionand
City Council feels that thechangesareappropriate.

Motion was made by Councilmember Bob Bowman and seconded by
CouncilmemberJack Gorden,Jr. that the Amendmentto the Zoning Ordinanceasit
relates to the “PUD” PlannedUnit DevelopmentDistrict be approved on First
Readingas presented. A unanimousaffirmative vote wasrecorded.

7. ORDINANCE - APPROVED - FIRST READING - CITY ELECTION

-

ESTABLISHING POLLING PLACES - SETTING ELECTION DATE

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwasFirst Readingof an
Ordinanceproviding for the calling of a City election,establishingpolling placesand
setting a date for the election. Mayor Bronaugh stated that positions for
Councilmemberof Ward 2, Councilmemberof Ward 4 and the Mayor will be voted
on.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat a copy of the municipal electioncalendarhad been
placedat eachCouncilmembersplaceat the Council table. City ManagerMaclin
statedthat the calendaris mandatedby the Secretaryof State’sOffice and is within
theguidelines asprescribedby the Secretaryof State.

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat he was informed at a meetingin Austin that this will
probablybe thelast electionin May.

Motion was made by Councilmember Tucker Weems and seconded by
CouncilmemberJack Gorden,Jr. that the Ordinanceproviding for the calling of a
City election,establishingpolling placesand setting the date for the election as
Saturday,May 3, 1997be approvedon First Readingas presented. A unanimous
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affirmative vote was recorded.

8. ABANDONMENT OF UNDEVELOPED RIGHTS-OF-WAY - APPROVED

-

BURKE CENTER - GREGORY AND GARY STREETS - FOREST ACRES
SUBDIVISION

Mayor Bronaugh stated that the next item for considerationwas the requestof
WayneHaglund, on behalfof Burke Centerto abandonthe undevelopedrights-of-
way of Gregory and Gary Streetslocated off FreemanStreetin the undeveloped
Forest AcresSubdivision.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat included in the Council packetis an explanationof
this requestand a recommendationby unanimousvote of the Planning & Zoning
Commission that both rights-of-way be abandoned,maps of the property, and
minutesof the Planning& Zoning Commissionmeeting.

Motion wasmadeby CouncilmemberBetty Jonesand secondedby Councilmember
Tucker Weemsthat the requestof WayneHaglund on behalf of Burke Centerto
abandonthe undevelopedrights-of-way of Gregory and Gary Streetslocated off
FreemanStreetin the undevelopedForestAcres Subdivisionbe approvedon First
Readingaspresented. A unanimousaffirmative votewas recorded.

9. RELOCATION OF UTILITIES - APPROVED - US 69 N AT LOOP 287

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas the relocationof
utilities on US 69 N at Loop 287.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat includedin the Council packetis a letter from the
City Engineerwith a recommendationregardingthis particularitem for funding, a
letter from Neal Clifton, the right-of-way agent for TxDOT stating the time and
urgencyof needfor the relocationof the sewerline, and a costestimatefrom Wayne
Stolz of EGA, with a budgetnecessaryfor the relocationin the amountof $220,440.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat this hasbeenan interestingdevelopmentin that
the City hastried for manymonths and evenheld up a contractorfrom relocating
the water lines waiting on the State to finish the right-of-way acquisition. City
ManagerMaclin statedthat the water line hasbeencompletedand the State has
given the City a very short time frame for the relocationof the sewerline. City
Manager Maclin statedthat the City doesnot have the $220,440budgetedin this
years budgetto takecareof this. City ManagerMaclin statedthat staff did budget
for the issuanceof revenuebondsto do threethings: (1) installationof clarifiers for
expansionof the WastewaterTreatmentPlant (2) drilling a new well to increaseour
water capacity,and (3) building an additional ground storagetank to improve the
City’s water capacityand water quality to provide additional retention time to help
aerate the hydrogensulfide. City ManagerMaclin statedthat the City Engineer’s
recommendationletter suggeststo Council that this $220,440 be added to the
revenuebond issue later on this summer. City Manager Maclin statedthat by
documentingthis in the Council minutes of this meeting, if we have any expense
prior to the issuanceof the bonds,we can take the Utility FundContingencyand
pay thoseexpensesthenreimburseourselvesupon delivery of the bond proceeds,
which we havedoneon previousoccasions. City ManagerMaclin statedthat since
TxDOT hasgiven suchshort notice, staff did not have the luxury of putting this
expensein the budget.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberBowman, City ManagerMaclin stated
that noneof this expenseis refundableto the City by TxDOT. City ManagerMaclin
statedthat TxDOTwill pay90%of theright-of-way acquisitioncosts.

CouncilmemberGordenaskedhow the city paid for the relocationof the water line
associatedwith this project. City ManagerMaclin statedthat the city had advance
warning and budgetedfor that expense. City EngineerWright statedit waspart of
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the original waterbond project.

CouncilmemberGordenaskedabout the total cost of the upcomingbond issuance.
Darryl Mayfield explainedthat a round figure is $3.025 million. Councilmember
Gordenaskedif therewereany otherfunding sources. Mr. Maclin statedtherewere
no othersourceshe would be willing to recommendat this time.

Motion was made by Councilmember Tucker Weems and seconded by
CouncilmemberJack Gorden,Jr. that funding for the relocationbe approvedand
that it come out of this year’s water utility revenuefund and then it will be
reimburseduponsaleof thebonds. A unanimousaffirmative votewasrecorded.

lOa. BID - APPROVED - HEADER PIPE - WATER UTILITIES - EAST TEXAS
UTILITY SUPPLY

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwasbids for headerpipe
for the Water Utilities Department.

City Manager Maclin statedthat the staff recommendationis the low bid of East
TexasUtility Supply in the amountof $67,774.40.

Motion was madeby CouncilmemberDon Boyd and secondedby Councilmember
TuckerWeemsthat the bid of EastTexasUtility Supply in the amountof $67,774.40
be approvedassubmitted. A unanimousaffirmative vote wasrecorded.

lOb. - BID - APPROVED - UTILITY CART - AZALEA TRAIL - PROFESSIONAL
TURF PRODUCTS

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwasbids for a utility cart
to be usedon the AzaleaTrail.

City Manager Maclin stated that the staff recommendationis the low bid of
ProfessionalTurf Productsin the amount of $14,257.99which includesa vehicle, a
generatorandpowertake-off. It will be usedfor maintenanceandsecuritypatrols.
Mr. Maclin statedthat this was a decision packagethat did not make the cut,
however,staff asksthat it be reconsideredbecauseit appearsto be essentialto keep
the trail in good condition.

Motion was madeby CouncilmemberDon Boyd and secondedby Councilmember
Jack Gorden, Jr. that the bid of ProfessionalTurf Products in the amount of
$14,257.99be approvedassubmitted. Thefollowing votewasrecorded:

Aye: CouncilmembersBoyd, Gorden,Jones,andMayor Bronaugh
Nay: CouncilmembersWeemsand Bowman

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the motion carriedwith a 4 to 2 vote.

11. UPGRADING OF ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS - APPROVED - MORRIS FRANK
PARK - LUFKIN YOUTH BASEBALL ASSN

.

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwasthe requestof Steve
Day, Lufkin Youth BaseballAssn., for upgradingof the electricalsystemat the major
leaguefield at Morris FrankPark.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat in the packetis a letter of requestfrom SteveDay
requestingfunding to improve the electrical service for GarrisonField at Morris
FrankPark. Mr. Maclin askDon Hannabas,Directorof Parks& LeisureServices,to
give an updateon this matter.

Mr. Hannabasstatedthat we haveoverloadedthe circuit to the high schoolbaseball
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field and arenow trying to eliminatethe problemand to keepour costof electricity
at the currentrate. He statedthat TU Electric hasagreedthat theseimprovements
will be considereda “grandfatheredservice” with the only cost to the city being to
hook up the new transformerto the existingfacilities at approximately$11,000. Mr.
Hannabasstatedthat in essence,the agreementrepresentsa cost savingsof about
$26,000.

CouncilmemberBetty Jonesaskedif this requestfits in with the masterplan for the
park. Mr. Hannabasreplied that we havehad discussionswith baseball,softball
and soccerand eventhoughthis is not the first priority, it is oneof the projectsthey
needed.

CouncilmemberTuckerWeemsaskedif the City paysfor the electricity to field 8 and
if they (high schoolbaseball)participatesin the cost. Mr. Hannabasstatedthat the
City pays the electricity but (they) havebeen responsiblefor most of the capital
improvementsto the field. In responseto anotherquestion,Mr. Hannabasstated
that the field is usedfor baseballby more thanjust thehigh schoolteam.

Councilmember Betty Jones asked about Lufkin High School’s plans to build
anotherfield.

Mr. SteveDay, Lufkin Youth BaseballAssn., cameforward andstatedthat a practice
field will be built andperhapsat somepoint in the future that might be expandedto
be an actualhigh school field. Mr. Day statedthat he would not recommendthat
becauseGarrisonField is oneof the finest high school fields in the stateif not the
nation.

Mr. Day statedthat the electricalserviceneedsto be upgradedbecausethe overall
complex needshave grown over the past twenty years. He statedthat when
everything is up and running, the demandfor electricity exceedswhat can be
suppliednow. This throwsbreakersandcauseslights to go out. Mr. Day stated
that he considersthis to be unsafefor thoseon the field and is afraid someonewill
be injured. He statedthat it is an inconvenienceand an embarrassmentwhen
hosting out of town teams. It takesanywherefrom 30 minutes to an hour for the
lights to comebackon.

Mr. Day statedthat TUElectric hasstatedthat thereis a window of opportunity that
won t last long which allows this reducedcost. The City will be paying for the
modification to the wiring of the field and to move the existing breakerpaneland
transformerinsidethe dressingroom. Leaving themoutsideis very dangerous.

Mr. Hannabasstatedthat the overheadline that comesacrossWindsor Drive may
be a problemwith the ParksandWildlife Departmentsincethe park was developed
with their grantmoney. Mr. Hannabasstatedthat he will try to get approvalfrom
ParksandWildlife to keepthe line overhead.

Mr. Maclin stated that in his experience,they have approved overheadlines on
existingstreetright-of-waybefore.

Motion was made by Councilmember Bob Bowman and seconded by
CouncilmemberBetty Jonesto approve the requestin an amount not to exceed
$11,000which will comefrom contingencyfunds. A unanimousaffirmative vote
wasrecorded.

12. EXECUTIVE SESSION

Mayor Bronaugh recessedRegular Sessionat 6:40 p.m. to enter into Executive
Session.Mayor Bronaugh reconvenedthe meeting at 6:56 p.m. and statedthat
Council had discussedpossiblelegal mattersandpersonnelmatters. No decisions
were made.
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13. COMMENTS

CouncilmemberDon Boyd askedif the City haslooked any further into building a
skateboardpark. Mr. Maclin respondedthat until the StateLegislaturedetermines
skateboardingto be a hazardoussport, liability insuranceis not available. Until
legislationis passed,a public facility is too risky.

CouncilmemberJack Gorden, Jr. stated that he would not mind repealing the
SkateboardOrdinance.

Mr. Maclin statedthat this Friday the Mayor and CountyJudgewill be speakingat
the First Friday Luncheon.

CouncilmemberBob Bowman statedthat the annualDETDA Banquetwill be on
February13th at 6:30 p.m. at Crown Colony. The Speakerswill be Representatives
Jim McReynoldsand WayneChristian.

Therebeingno further businessfor consideration,meetingadjournedat 7:03 p.m.

Atha Stokes- City Secretary

2/04/97 10


