
MINUTES OF REGULAR MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF
THE CITY OF LUFKIN. TEXAS, HELD ON THE

19TH DAY OF AUGUST, 1997AT 5:00 P.M

.

On the 19th day of August, 1997 the City Council of theCity of Lufkin, Texas,
convenedin a regular meeting in the Council Chambersof City Hall with the
following membersthereof,to wit:

Louis A. Bronaugh Mayor
PercySimond Councilmember,Ward No. 1
Betty Jones Councilmember,Ward No. 3
Bob Bowman Councilmember,WardNo. 4
JackGorden,Jr. Councilmember,WardNo. 5
Tucker Weems Councilmember,Ward No. 6
C. G. Maclin City Manager
Bob Flournoy City Attorney
Atha Stokes City Secretary
Keith Wright City Engineer
StephenAbraham Director of Planning
Kenneth Williams Director of Public Works

beingpresent,and

Don Boyd Mayorpro tem

1. Meetingwasopenedwith prayerby Rev. Keith Whitaker, Minister, FirstUnited

MethodistChurch.

2. Mayor Bronaugh welcomedvisitors present.

3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES

Motion was made by Councilmember Tucker Weems and secondedby
Councilmember JackGorden,Jr. that the minutesof the Called Meeting of July
22, 1997andthe Regular Meeting of August5, 1997be approvedaspresented. A
unanimousaffirmative vote was recorded.

4. ORDINANCES - APPROVED- SECONDREADING - ANNEXATION - ZONING
- RESIDENTIAL LARGE - UNITED PENTECOSTALCHURCH - U S59AND FM 819

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat thenext item for considerationwasSecondReadingof
an Ordinancefor the annexationof and appropriatezoning classificationfor two
tracts of land comprising approximately 29.3895 acres adjacent to the United
PentecostalCampgroundand generallylocated at the southwestcornerof U. S.
Highway59 andFM 819.

Motion was made by CouncilmemberJack Gorden, Jr. and secondedby
CouncilmemberBetty Jonesthat Ordinancefor the annexationof, and a zoning
classificationof ResidentialLarge, for two tractsof land comprisingapproximately
29.3895acresadjacentto theUnited PentecostalCampgroundand generallylocated
at thesouthwestcornerof U. S. Highway59 andFM 819be approvedon Secondand
FinalReadingaspresented. A unanimousaffirmative votewasrecorded.

5. ORDINANCE - APPROVED - SECOND READING - SUBDIVISION ORDINANCE
- DRAINAGE CRITERIA MANUAL

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwasSecondReadingof
an Ordinanceto amendthe SubdivisionOrdinanceto include the approvalof the
DrainageCriteria Manual.

Motion was made by Councilmember Bob Bowman and secondedby
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CouncilmemberBetty Jones that the amendmentto the SubdivisionOrdinance
including the DrainageCriteria Manualbe approvedon SecondandFinal Reading
aspresented. A unanimousaffirmativevotewas recorded.

6. ORDINANCE - APPROVED - SECOND READING - RIGHT - OF - WAY
ABANDONMENT - FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH - CIMMARON STREET

Mayor Bronaugh stated that the next item for consideration was SecondReading of
an Ordinance for the abandonment of street right-of-way adjacentto the First
ChristianChurchat CimmaronStreet.

Motion was made by Councilmember Bob Bowman and secondedby
CouncilmemberTucker Weems that Ordinancefor the abandonmentof street
right-of-way adjacentto theFirst ChristianChurchat CimmaronStreetbe approved
aspresented.

Mayor Bronaugh recusedhimself from voting. Motion carried with five
affirmativevotes.

7. ORDINANCE - APPROVED - FIRST READING - SITE PLAN APPROVAL

-

SOUTH LOOP CROSSING SHOPPING CENTER - LOOP 287 - HARMONY HILL
DRIVE - TULANE DRIVE - COMMERCIAL DISTRICT

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas the requestof
Philip Goodwin,on behalfof KenSmith, for site planapprovalof a shoppingcenter
to be known as SouthLoop CrossinglocatedbetweenLoop 287 (5. Medford Drive)
and Harmony Hill Drive and Tulane Drive located within a “C” Commercial
District.

City ManagerMaclin statedthatincludedin theCouncil packetis a memofrom the
PlanningDepartmentalong with a recommendationfrom the Planning& Zoning
Commissionby unanimousvote for approvalof the proposedsite plan with two
conditions: (1) Accessto the site from theLoop 287 frontageroad shall conform to
the on-site improvementsshown on the site plan. (The improvementsare
recommendedby the Traffic EngineeringStudypreparedby ParsonsTransportation
Group for the City of Lufkin.) and, (2) The City Engineershall approvethe
necessarystormwaterrun off facilities for the site prior to the issuanceof the first
building permit.

CouncilmemberJonesaskedhow thestormwater run off fits in with the Tulane
Drive reconstruction. City ManagerMaclin statedthat the City hasthebenefit of
the Engineeringfirm providing the servicesfor both theTulane project andthe
SouthLoop Crossingproject,and aswasmentionedin item #2 this plat in termsof
what is actuallybuilt in termsof squarefootageof abuilding couldbe revised. City
ManagerMaclin statedthat oncea final plan is submittedfor constructionpurposes
then staff will be able to more accuratelyidentify the necessarystorm run off
precautions,whetherthatbe retention/detention,or whatever.

Motion was made by Councilmember Bob Bowman and seconded by
CouncilmemberJackGorden,Jr. that requestof Philip Goodwinon behalfof Ken
Smith for site plan approval of a shoppingcenter to be known as South Loop
CrossinglocatedbetweenLoop 287 (5. Medford Drive) andHarmonyHill Drive and
Tulane Drive locatedwithin a “C” CommercialDistrict be approvedaspresented.
A unanimousaffirmative vote wasrecorded.

8. ORDINANCE - APPROVED - FIRST READING - ZONE CHANGE

-

RESIDENTIAL MEDIUM SINGLE FAMILY TO COMMERCIAL DISTRICT - 1600
SAYERS STREET - HOOD DAVIS

Mayor Bronaugh stated that the next item for consideration wasthe request of Hood
Davis to change the zoning from “RM” ResidentialMedium Single Family to “C”
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CommercialDistrict on propertylocatedat 1600 SayersStreet.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat included in the Council packetis a memorandum
from the PlanningDepartmentproviding an explanationof this requestand the
current conditions. City Manager Maclin stated that the Planning & Zoning
Commissionby unanimousvote recommendsapproval of the zone changeas
requested.

Motion was made by Councilmember Tucker Weems and secondedby
Councilmember Jack Gorden,Jr. that Ordinancefor a zone changefrom “RM”
ResidentialMedium Single Family to “C” CommercialDistrict on property located
at 1600 SayersStreetas requestedby HoodDavis be approvedon First Readingas
presented.

CouncilmemberPercySimond recusedhimself from voting. Motion carried with
five affirmative votes.

9. COPSGRANT - APPROVED - U. S.DEPARTMENT OF CRIMINAL JUSTICE

-

POLICE OFFICERS

Mayor Bronaughstatedthatthe next item for considerationwasparticipationin the
U. S. Departmentof Criminal JusticeCOPSGrant for hiring four additionalpolice
officers for gangintervention.

City ManagerMaclin statedthatthis wasan applicationthatChiefCollinsbroughtto
Council earlier in theyear. City ManagerMaclin statedthat theCity hasbeenvery
successfulin applicationsto the Criminal JusticeDepartmentunder the COPS
program. City ManagerMaclin statedthat staff is extremelysurprisedbut also
pleasedthat the City hasbeengrantedpermissionto be recipientsof anothergrant
pendingCouncil’s authorization. City ManagerMaclin statedthat Chief Collins
said that if the City was approvedwithout a waiver of the matchfund he would
comebackto seekCouncil’s confirmation. City ManagerMaclin statedthat Chief
Collins hasprovideda brief memoin the Council packetthat outlines the financial
impact for this fiscal year. City ManagerMaclin statedthat the net impact for the
City would bethe$16,562figure,andChiefCollin’s budgetwould obviouslyhaveto
be amendedby $83,124for thisyearon theexpenditureside. City ManagerMaclin
statedthat on therevenuesidethe $50,000Departmentof JusticeGrant would be
addedandthe $16,562thatLISD hascommittedto help participatein theprogram.
City ManagerMaclin statedthat beforeconsideringthe AppropriationsOrdinance,
which is thenext item on theagenda, staff wantedto seekCouncil’s consideration.
City ManagerMaclin statedthat if Council were to approvethis, then theupdated
numbersthat would be handedout at the September2nd meeting would reflect
thesechangesto thePoliceDepartmentandto the revenuesideof thebudget.

Chief Collins statedthat this requestcovers the 1997-’98 fiscal yearswith those
amounts. Chief Collins statedthat the PoliceDepartmenthasgottenpermission
from the Departmentof Justiceto expandthe grant in the 1999 fiscal year if we so
chooseby two officers,andthefollowing yearby two more. ChiefCollins statedthat
the Departmentchoseto go for two officers at a time. Chief Collins statedthat
basicallywhat Council is looking at for the1999 fiscal year is with four officers it
would double the figures for two ($16,562x 2 = $33,124),andif kept at thesame
level for the third yearof the grant it would be double,and if expandedto six
officers it would triple thefigures ($16,562x 3 = $49,686);the fourthyearof thegrant
wouldbe 100%financedby theCity. ChiefCollins statedthattheCity is lookingat
the responsibilityof funding theseofficers 100% the fourth year of any contract
Council approves. Chief Collins statedthat, in his opinion,theprogramwould be
well enoughreceivedby LISD that they would want to continueto participatein it
andwould probably help sharethecost,but he could not speakfor LISD. Chief
Collins statedthat if theCity could work out a dealwith LISD, thenthe fourthyear
of funding would notbe soburdensomeon theCity. ChiefCollins statedthatthese
officers would be used primarily in the schools to teach the Gang Reduction
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Education Program,which is very similar to the DARE educationprogram. Chief
Collins statedthat the GREAT Programis aimedat middle schoolandhigh school
students,wherethegangproblemreally exists. ChiefCollins statedthatthe GREAT
program officers would also work with the juvenile probationdepartmentin a
more traditional police role than just educators. Chief Collins statedthat the
officers would spend about 20 hours a week in the classroom in education
processesand the rest of their duty time would be in more traditional police
functions.

In responseto questionby Mayor Bronaugh,Chief Collins statedthat the officers
primary focuswill be to work with thepresentgang problemsin theCity.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberSimond,Chief Collins statedthat he
requestedanexclusionor waiverof theCity havingto pay thefourth yearsexpenses
andit was denied. CouncilmemberSimondstatedthat he hadsomeproblemswith
this Grant,in that theCity recentlyhired sevenadditionalofficers througha grant
program,andhe did not rememberanyonesayingthat theCity would haveto ftmd
theseofficersafter thegrantwas ended. In responseto questionby Councilmember
Simond, City ManagerMaclin statedthat it coststheCity a little lessthan$300,000to
fund theseofficers. CouncilmemberSimondstatedthat he wasnot too surethat
this was not just a gimmick by theJusticeDepartment. Mayor Bronaughstated
that, in his opinion, the JusticeDepartmentis trying to encouragecities to do
something and by giving the City $50,000 to start the program it is an
encouragement. CouncilmemberGordenstatedthat he rememberedChief Collins
saying that after the program had run its coursethe City was not required to
maintainthoseofficers. Chief Collins statedthat theCity hasthe option after the
fourth year to do whateverit wantsto with the officers,evendroppingthem from
the force if you so desire. City ManagerMaclin statedthattheCity could notdrop
theofficers the fourthyear,but could drop themthe fifth year. ChiefCollins stated
that this is a four yearcontractwith theJusticeDepartmentparticipatingfor three
years. In responseto questionby CouncilmemberBowman,ChiefCollins stated
that 1998 will the fourth yearof the grant for thesevenofficers. City Manager
Maclin statedthathe believesthattheway theJusticeDepartmentlooks at the grant
is that if theyareat a pointwheretheCouncilandthecitizensfeel like theresaneed
for additional officers this is a way to get it supplementedfor at least threeyears.
City Manager Maclin stated that when we got the other sevenofficers in the
utilization of CommunityPolicing, staff felt like it wasappropriatebecausethe City
wasgrowingandtherewasaneedfor additionalpolice officersandthiswasaway to
grow” the City without having to bearthe full expensethe first threeyears. City

ManagerMaclin statedthat what Chief Collins, and more specifically theJustice
Departmentis saying,is if you feel like gang interventionis somethingthat is a
needfor the communitythey arewilling to provide the pilot seedmoney for the
first threeyears,andthentheCity pick it up afterthat.

Chief Collins statedthat juvenilecrime is wheretheCity’s real growth of crime is
right now, all other areasof crime in Lufkin havebeenon the decrease.Chief
Collins statedthatjuvenilecrime is like 150% of what it wassix yearsago.

CouncilmemberGordenstatedthat Council mayneedto go aheadandapprovethis
Grant,but he wonderedif it werepossiblefor Chief Collins to switchsomeof his
existing resourcesaround. Chief Collins statedthat his Departmentis stretched
aboutasthin asit canbe. ChiefCollins statedthatif theGrantis notapprovedby
Council he would have to pull two patrol officers off the street for gang
intervention. Chief Collins statedthat one thing he would like to point out is
that the people of Lufkin pay taxes from wherethis money comes from and if
Lufkin doesnot askfor it’s sharethemoneywill go somewhereelse.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberBowman, Chief Collins statedthatthe
sevenofficers werehired for the specificpurposeof implementingthe community
policing program,a different conceptof policing. ChiefCollinsstatedthatin those
areaswhere the Departmenthasbeen able to utilize thoseresources, they have
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droppedthecrime ratesignificantly andincreasedthequality of life in thoseareas.
Chief Collins statedthat he would invite Council to contactRev. Simmonswho was
the head of the Lufkin Land group, Benny Moye in North Lufkin, and the
PinewoodPark residentsto explain the differenceof the living conditionsthere
today ascomparedto threeyearsago. ChiefCollins statedthat thisprogramhas
hada good dealof success,andthat hemeasuredthesuccessby thecalls for service
from thoseareas. Chief Collins statedthat thecalls aredownsignificantly where
the Departmenthas beenable to saturatethose areaswith community police
officers to develop the community supportthat they need, and get the residents
organizedso that they betterunderstandhow they can help the Departmentto
reducethecrime andtheproblem. Chief Collins statedthat theprogramaddresses
abandonedhousesandall theotherthingsthat haveanimpacton thequality of life.

In responseto question by CouncilmemberJones, Chief Collins stated that
SuperintendentSharp understandsthat it is a threeyear grant and has verbally
committedto thedurationof the grant;he doesnot haveanythingin writing from
him, but Mr. Sharp is very supportive. Chief Collins statedthat Mr. Sharphas
signedon to submit asmuch as$18,000this year,andit turnedout to be lessthan
that. Chief Collins statedthat when the grant is in the fourth year, it will be
subjectto negotiationswith LISD. City ManagerMaclin statedthat, in his opinion,
their participationwould be basedon the successof the program. City Manager
Maclin statedthat LISD is paying 100% for theschool resourceofficer during the
schoolyear. Chief Collins statedthatthis is the third or fourth yearthat LISD has
paid 100%.

ChiefCollins statedthathebelievesthatLISD views this asan opportunityto create
their own police departmentby getting a nucleusof officers working in there.
Chief Collins stated that he has encouraged LISD to get their own police
department.

In responseto questionby Coi.mcilmemberGorden,ChiefCollinsstatedthatthis is a
75/65/60grant,but the moneywill still be samewith the City getting $25,000per
officer peryear.

CouncilmemberSimondstated that there is a rashof fires all over the country,
which are probably arsonandprobably startedby juveniles,andwonderedif the
JusticeDepartmenthasappropriatedany money for the fire departmentfor this
samesort of money. City ManagerMaclin statedthat he did not think so.
CouncilmemberSimond stated that this is one of those “feel good” programs
administeredby theJusticeDepartment. CouncilmemberSimondstatedthat he
wasnot toosurethatthis is nothingbut political. CouncilmemberSimondstated
thatwhatmakeshim unhappyaboutthegrant is thattheyareforcingtheCity to pay
$300,000a year,plus this grant, and the City did not institute this program,the
JusticeDepartmentdid. CouncilmemberSimondstatedthathe wasnothappythat
theCity is forced to participatein this programandnothing is doneaboutthe fire
departmentin this countryandespeciallyin thisCity. MayorBronaughstatedthat
he did not think that theCity is beingforced to participate in this grantprogram,
and was not forced to participatein the Community Policing Grant Program.
CouncilmemberSimond statedthat theselling point is that the City will getpolice
protection. Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the sevenofficers that the City hired
throughtheCommunity Policing Programarecertainly doing their jobs andit has
shownon the reductionof callsandcrimesin theareasthathadproblems.

CouncilmemberJonesstatedthatif this problemdoesexist, andsheis hearingthatit
does, then Council doeshave a responsibilitymaybeto help the schoolprovide
somesafetyfor the students. CouncilmemberJonesstatedthat sheunderstands
that you haveto look at this long termandat theendthe City will be fundingthe
programcompletely, and that bothersher too, but if we have a problemin the
schoolto thatextent,thenthatbothers her also.

Chief Collins askedCouncil not to misinterpret whathe saysaboutthe problemin
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theschool; it is not a “school” problem, it manifestsitself in school,but our society
takesit to schoolwith them.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberBowman,Chief Collins statedthat he
hasnot discussedwith Mr. Sharpwhether the schoolwould bewilling to carry on
this programoncethegranthasexpired.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberSimond,Chief Collins statedthat the
initial start up cost is the thing that is keepingLISD from having its own Police
Department. ChiefCollins statedthat if LISD were to employ aPoliceDepartment
today they need to hire a minimum of three and perhapsfour full time police
officers, andthey are strappedfor moneyjust like all other governmentalagencies
are.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberGorden,Chief Collins statedthat the
additionof two GREAT policeofficerswould bring his staffnumberup to 71.

CouncilmemberSimond statedthat at theCouncil RetreattheMayor statedthat he
would like to seetwo policemenriding in eachcarat night. ChiefCollins statedthat
there are somebenefitsas well as somenegative aspects;as far as dangerto the
officer, it is more dangerousto havetwo officers working togetherthan working
single like the Departmentdoes. Chief Collins statedthat the Department
provides a backup officer to any call that is judged potentially dangerousof any
level. Chief Collins statedthat statisticsbearout thatmoreofficers arekilled and
injured working as partners on a percentagebasis than individually, due to
carelessness.

CouncilmemberBowman stated that he sharedMr. Simond’s concern about
committing Council’s future expenditures,but it is clear that Chief Collins has
outlineda problemthat needsattention.

Motion was made by CouncilmemberBob Bowman and secondedby
CouncilmemberBetty Jonesthat requestfor participationin the U. S. Departmentof
Criminal JusticeCOPS Grant for hiring two additional police officers for gang
intervention be approved as presented. A unanimousaffirmative vote was
recorded.

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat Mrs. Garnerand Mrs. Menefeewere presentin the
audienceandwantedto visit with Council aboutthegangproblemsat a future date,
andwould visit with thePoliceChief afterthemeeting.

10. APPROPRIATIONSORDINANCE - APPROVED - FIRST READING

MayorBronaughstatedthat thenext item for considerationwasFirstReadingof the
AppropriationsOrdinance.

City ManagerMaclin statedthatapproximatelya monthagotherewasabudgetdraft
presentation,then a Public HearingwhereCouncil concurredwith somerevisions
to thebudgetandthosehavebeenreflected.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat thechangeswere to haveno increasein waterand
sewerratesand for thesewerextensionproject on the south sideof town that we
would either use contingencyfunds or Mr. Gordensuggested consideringthe
issuanceof revenuebonds. City ManagerMaclin statedthat if theCity issueddebt
it would not impact the rate structureuntil next year as far as debt retirementis
concerned.

City Manager Maclin stated that the other change from the budget draft
presentationwasto lower theincreasein solid wasteratesfrom 7% to 4%.

Motion was made by Councilmember Tucker Weems and seconded by
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CouncilmemberBob Bowmanthat the AppropriationsOrdinancebe approvedon

FirstReadingaspresented. A unanimousaffirmativevotewasrecorded.

11. TAX LEVYING ORDINANCE - APPROVED - FIRST READING

Mayor Bronaughstatedthatthenext item for considerationwasFirstReadingof the

Tax Levying Ordinance.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat for items 11, 13 and 14 there is someupdated
informationon theCouncil table that reflectsaccuratenumbersthat are minor in
change. City ManagerMaclin statedthat theOrdinanceon theCouncil tableretains
thecurrenttax rateof .4869centsper$100valuation.

In responseto questionby Mayor Bronaugh,City ManagerMaclin statedthat the
recommendationis to retain thecurrenttax rateof .4869 centsper $100 valuation,
.36631centsof that dedicatedfor maintenanceandsupportof generalgovernment,
and .120667for interestandsinkingfund for debtretirement.

Motion was made by Councilmember Bob Bowman and seconded by
CouncilmemberTuckerWeemsthatFirst Readingof the Tax Levying Ordinancebe
approvedon First Readingas presented. A unanimousaffirmative vote was
recorded.

12. ORDINANCE - APPROVED - FIRST READING - REVISION OF SOLID WASTE
RATES

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat thenext item for considerationwasFirst Readingof an
Ordinancerevisingthe Solid Wasterates.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat asmentionedthis revisionrepresentsa 4% increase
acrosstheboardincreaseexcludingsalestax, a .51 centpermonthincreaseincluding
Statesalestax for a total increaseof .55 centsper monthperresidentialcustomerand
a .21 centpercubicyard increasefor thebasicpercubic yardratefrom $5.18to $5.39
percubic yard.

Motion was made by Councilmember Bob Bowman and secondedby
CouncilmemberJackGorden,Jr. that Ordinancerevisingthe Solid Wasteratesbe
approvedon First Reading as presented. A unanimousaffirmative vote was
recorded.

13. ORDINANCE - APPROVED - FIRST READING - REVISION OF WATER AND
SEWER TAP FEES

Mayor Bronaughstatedthatthenext item for considerationwasFirst Readingof an
OrdinancerevisingtheWaterand Sewertap fees.

City ManagerMaclin statedthatthis doesnot raisethebasewater andsewerrates;
however, Council has reiteratedfrom time to time that they would like for the
EnterpriseFundservicesto be self-sustaining. City ManagerMaclin statedthaton
theCouncil tablewasanupdatedversionof theOrdinancein thepacketthatreflects
a proposedincreasein water and sewertap feesthat either is our actual costsor
coincideswith the averageof thesefeesandservicesasshownon thesurveyfrom
otherscities shown in the Council packet (including Nacogdoches,Huntsville,
ConroeandLongview).

Kenneth Williams, Public Works Director, statedthat included in the Council
packetis informationon theproposedrevisionin waterandsewertap fee rates,and
aspreadsheetwith a costanalysisfees vs actualcosttheCity is actuallyincurringfor
sewerand water taps. Mr. Williams statedthat thecost sheetsreflect that the
current fees are considerablylower than the actual cost for installation. Mr.
Williams statedthat the next pageis a surveyof othercities costs,and theCity of
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Lufkin is considerablylower than thesecities averagewise. Mr. Williams stated
thatstaff is wantingto getthe feesmorein line with theactualcoststo theCity.

Motion was made by CouncilmemberJack Gorden, Jr. and secondedby
Councilmember Tucker Weemsthat First Readingof an Ordinancerevising the
waterandsewertap feesbe approvedaspresented. A unanimousaffirmativevote
wasrecorded.

14. REVISIONOFEMS RATES

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat thenext item for considerationwas the revisionof the
EMS rates.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat included in theCouncil packetis a memofrom the
Fire Chief alongwith a BaseRateSurveyfor both emergencyand non-emergency
service. City ManagerMaclin statedthat thesurveyincludesMarshall,Edgewood,
Frankston,Gladewater,Henderson,HoustonCounty, Longview, Lufkin, Mineola,
Panola County, Rusk, Smith County, Texarkana,Troup/Arp, Lufkin/Center,
Nacogdoches,and Livingston dependingon whetherit is Gaddy’sor Nacogdoches
EMS that is providing the service. City ManagerMaclin statedthat aspreviously
discussedat the budgetretreatandthe budgetdraft presentation,staff felt that the
timing wasappropriateto considerraisingthebaserate in theCity from $175 to $250
per call. City ManagerMaclin statedthat theMedicare/Medicaidreimbursement
rate is predicatedon an averageof the area,and the averagein the area is much
higher thanwhat Lufkin is charging,andtheCity is actually missingout on some
potentialreimbursement. City ManagerMaclin statedthat theseniorcitizenswho
areon Medicareandthoseindigentswho areon Medicaidwould notbe impactedby
this rate increase,it wouldjustprovideadditional fundingfrom thosesourcesto the
City for reimbursement. City ManagerMaclin statedthat in comparisonwith
other cities this rate increaseis not excessive,in fact, will still be below the average
not only in the baserate for emergencyand non-emergency,but with minor
exceptions,costpermile. City ManagerMaclinstatedthatthelast rateincreasewas
a little overfour yearsago.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat on the Council table is some information that
reflectshow thesefeeswereestimatedandwhat the increasewould be in revenues.

CouncilmemberSimondstatedthat he was in agreementfor the rateincreasebut
thoughtit was injudiciousof someonewho said thattheCity could usethis increase
to build thenew fire station. CouncilmemberSimondstatedthat this couldhave
beena misprint, and he did not think that this statementwould make a good
sellingpoint.

Motion was made by Councilmember Percy Simond and seconded by
CouncilmemberJackGorden,Jr. that revisionof the EMS ratesfrom $175percall to
$250per callbeapprovedaspresented.

CouncilmemberBowmanstatedthat he agreedwith Mr. Simond on the comment
of building the fire stationon the backsof peoplewho getcarried in ambulances;
this wasnot very judiciousandhe hopedthat we would stopusing thatstatement.

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat therewas a misprint in the newspaperregardingthe
figures,andalso a misunderstandingof the increasealso.

CouncilmemberWeemsstatedthathe would like for ChiefPrewitt to comeforward
andexplain the differencein the newspaperarticle this morning aboutthe 10,000
EMS calls times. Chief Prewitt statedthat he hadexplainedto Doug Criss (Lufkin
Newsreporter)yesterdaythattheFire Department’soverall anticipatedcall volume
this yearwould be approximately10,000. Chief Prewittstatedthat of those10,000
calls approximately30% occurred in the City, which amountedto 1,347 calls this
previousyear. Chief Prewitt statedthat 1,347 times $75 (the proposedincrease)
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would generate$101,000; $101,000 times the collection rate for the emergency
division, which is about50%) would gain $50,000 within the emergencydivision.
Chief Prewitt statedthat within the routine division, using the sameformula, the
Fire Departmentwould receive approximately$105,000basedon the 1996 call
volume.

Chief Prewitt statedthat he would like to apologizefor anything that might seem
inappropriatein thenewspaperarticle. Chief Prewitt statedthat he did tell the
newspaperreporterthatit waspartof his proposalduringthisbudgetsessionthatan
increasein revenues(should they be approved) be allocatedtoward a new fire
station. ChiefPrewitt statedthatit washis personalbelief that costsfor thingslike a
fire station,which doesinclude ambulancework, shouldbe incurredby the end
user,which is thepatient. Chief Prewitt statedthatthe Fire Stationsdo a lot more
than just EMS work, so if his commentto the paperwere anywherenearbeing
inappropriate,he would apologize.

Chief Prewitt statedthat theDepartmentwould generate approximately$155,000
basedon the 1996 call volume rate shouldCouncil approvethis requesttonight.
Chief Prewittstatedthatthis figure will increasein the future.

A unanimousaffirmative vote wasrecorded.

CouncilmemberSimond complimentedChief Prewitt on the excellent job he is

doing for theFire Department.

15. BID - APPROVED - FUEL AND LUBRICANT CONTRACT - POLK OIL CO

.

MayorBronaughstatedthatthenext item for considerationwasbids for thefuel and
lubricant contract.

City ManagerMaclin statedthatincludedin theCouncil packetis thebid tabulation
for both the rolling stockandthe fuel andlubricantbulk delivery. Threebidswere
received on the rolling stock and staff only received one bid on the fuel and
lubricant. City ManagerMaclin statedthatin both casesthe low bid is from Polk Oil
Company. City ManagerMaclin statedthatpredicatedon thepredeterminedgallon
estimate(quantityestimate),the estimatedtotal bid is $188,806for the rolling stock
fuel and $25,220.30for the fuel andlubricantbulk delivery. City ManagerMaclin
statedthatit is staff’s recommendationto go with the low bid of PolkOil Company.

Motion was made by Councilmember Bob Bowman and seconded by
CouncilmemberJackGorden,Jr. thatthebid of Polk Oil Companyfor both the fuel
andlubricantbulk delivery andthe fuel for rolling stockbe approvedassubmitted.
A unanimousaffirmative vote wasrecorded.

16. BID - TABLED - PHASEI CONSTRUCTION- TULANE DRIVE

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwasbids for PhaseI of
the constructionon TulaneDrive.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat staff had discussedwith Council sometime back
aboutthepotentialphasingof theTulaneDrive construction project for purposesof
beingableto start andmoveforward with the areawherethepropertyacquisition
had beencompleted. City ManagerMaclin statedthat by putting in the smaller
units it could possiblyattractadditionalbidderswho might not be able to get the
bondingfor a multi-million dollar contract. City ManagerMaclin statedthatPhase
I hasbeenadvertised.

Philip Goodwin,ProjectEngineer,statedthatthis projectis PhaseI of Tulaneandis
a short sectionof Tulanethatruns in a north/southdirectionbetweenLoop 287and
HarmonyHill Drive. Mr. Goodwin statedthat an additional reasonfor bidding it
outearlywas that all of the acquisitionwascompletedin this area. Mr. Goodwin
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statedthat three separatepavementoptions were bid and the first option was
reenforcedconcrete pavementand came in at $325,931.44;option two was an
asphalticpavementwith a limestonebaseand camein at $289,256.34;and, option
threewasa full depthasphaltandthelow priceon it was$325,975.36. Mr. Goodwin
statedthat therewas an additive alternatefor sidewalkson onesideof the street
and it came in at $29,058. Mr. Goodwin statedthat in all casesTimberline
Constructionof Lufkin is the low bidder.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat one question that had beenasked of him by
multiple Councilmemberswas if we have the option, and was there potential
benefitto reject all bids andrebid theentireTulaneprojectasoneprojectratherthan
thephasing. City ManagerMaclin statedthat only two bids were receivedandwe
were not able to accomplishwhat we had hopedto accomplishwith a smaller
contractby attractingmultiple additionalbidders. City ManagerMaclin statedthat
Council doeshavetheoption, theway thisprojectwasbid, to rejectall bidsandthen
come back in approximately four months, dependingupon some property
acquisitionand utility relocation,and rebid the entireprojectwith all threephases
together. City Manager Maclin stated that one local contractorhad been
questionedas to his opinion that if we did that it would lower our bids from our
currentcostperfoot of this section,andit washis opinion,thatwe would gain better
economiesof scale,and sometheoreticaloverheadcostreduction. City Manager
Maclin statedthat of the four bond streets,Tulanehasthegreatestlinear footageof
anyof the four streets.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberBowman,City ManagerMaclin stated
that rebidding Tulane would delay the start of the project a minimum of four
months. City ManagerMaclin statedthat staff could instruct the contractorto bid
PhaseI first so that we do nothinderdevelopmentin that area,which is something
to beconsidered.

MayorBronaughaskedif thebidding processcould takeplacewithout securingall
of the right-of-way acquisition. City Manager Maclin statedthat this is not
normally a wise practice,becauseif you have to condemnany of the right-of-way,
theproceedingscantakeaslong as60 days. City ManagerMaclinstatedthataNotice
to Proceedcannotbe issued until all of the right-of-way is secured,deedand title
obtainedandutilities relocatedfrom the right-of-way. City ManagerMaclin stated
that in PhaseIII therearesomeadditionalutility considerationsto takeinto account
andPhaseIII hasmorenew construction. City ManagerMaclin statedthat Phase
III of Tulane is the only one of the four bond streets that actually has new
construction. City ManagerMaclin statedthat meanswe are not going over an
existing streetright-of-way; the realignmentasCouncil approvedapproximately 24
monthsagodoescall for a straighteningto maintaina paralleldistancefrom U. 5. 59
sothat it will be movedto theeastandnot beright behindtheForestServiceasit is
now, but right in thatcurve it will straightenout and thenalign with David Street.
City ManagerMaclin statedthat therewill actuallybe severalhundredfeet of new
constructionin that area. Therewill alsobe someadditional stormsewerand
drainageconsiderationsthat haveto be addressedin PhaseIII that arenot a part of
PhaseII; therearesomedrainagestructuresin PhaseI also.

CouncilmemberWeemsaskedif therewould be any problemif this wastableduntil
nextmeeting. City ManagerMaclin statedthat thebid is goodfor 75 days.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberBowman,City ManagerMaclin stated
that he did not seetheCity receivingany bids on PhaseII and PhaseII until late
October,bestcasescenario.

Motion was made by Councilmember Tucker Weems and secondedby
CouncilmemberPercy Simond that this item be tabled until the next Council
meeting,September2.

The following vote wasrecorded:
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Aye: CouncilmembersWeems,Simond,Gorden,Jones,Mayor Bronaugh

Nay: CouncilmemberBowman

Motion carriedwith five affirmative votes.

17. EXECUTIVE SESSION

RegularSessionwasrecessedat 6:00 p. m. to enterinto ExecutiveSession. Regular
Sessionreconvenedat 6:29 p. m. andMayorBronaughstatedthatlegal mattershad
beendiscussedandno decisionsweremade.

18. COMMENTS

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the DETCOG meetingwill be held next Thursdayin
Trinity. Mayor Bronaughstatedthat this Sundayafternoonat 1:30 p.m. therewill
be a ribboncuttinganda groundbreakingat theEllen TroutZoo.

City ManagerMaclin statedthathe appreciatedCouncil’s participationin thebudget
process.

19. There being no further businessfor consideration,meetingadjournedat 6:30
p.m.
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