
MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF TIlE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
LUFKIN, TEXAS HELD ON THE

5
TH DAY OF APRIL, 2005

Onthe
5

TH dayof April 2005,theCity Councilof theCity of Lufkin, Texasconvenedina RegularMeeting
in theCouncilChambersof City Hall with thefollowing members,thereofto wit:

Louis Bronaugh
RoseFameBoyd
R. L. Kuykendall
Lynn Tones
Don Langston
DennisRobertson
PaulL. Parker
ReneeThompson
RobertFlournoy
Keith Wright
KennethWilliams
David Koonce
Larry Brazil
Don Hannabas
BeaufordChapman
ScottMarcotte
DougWood
PetePrewitt
StevePoskey

beingpresent,and

JackGorden,Jr.

Mayor
Mayorpro tern
Councilmember,WardNo. 1
Coundilmember,WardNo. 3
Councilmember,WardNo. 4
Councilmember,WardNo. 6
City Manager
City Secretary
City Attorney
City Engineer
PublicWorksDirector
Directorof HumanResources
PoliceChief
ParksandLeisureServicesDirector
Directorof InspectionServices
Asst. PoliceChief
Directorof Accounting
FireChief
StreetDepartment,Superintendent

Councilmember,WardNo. 5

beingabsent,whenthefollowing businesswas transacted:

1. Themeetingwasopenedwith prayerby ReverendEddieBallard,First BaptistKelty’s.

2. MayorLouis Bronaughwelcomedvisitorspresent.MayorBronaughalsorecognizedBoy ScoutTroop
134 who were attendingthe Council meetingand working on their merit badges. Councilmember
Lynn TonesrecognizedLHS studentswho werepresentsatisfyingtheirgovernmentclassrequirement.

3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES

Minutesof the RegularMeetingon March 15, 2005 andtheEmergencyMeeting on March 18, 2005
wereapprovedon a motion by CouncilmemberR. L. Kuykendall, andsecondedby Councilmember
RoseFameBoyd. A unanimousaffirmativevotewasrecorded.

OLD BUSINESS:

4. SECONDREADING OF AN ORDINANCE DECLARING UNOPPOSEDCANDIDATES FOR
WARDS NUMBER FIVE (5) AND SIX (6) IN THE MAY 07, 2005 GENERAL CITY
ELECTION, - APPROVED - ELECTED TO OFFICE; CANCELING THE ELECTION

;

PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE, AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE

Mayor Louis Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas the SecondReadingof an
Ordinancedeclaringunopposedcandidatesfor Wards NumberFive (5) and Six (6) in the May 07,
2005 GeneralCity Election,electedto office; cancelingtheelection;providing a severabilityclause,
andprovidinganeffectivedate.

CouncilmemberLynn Tones moved to approve on Second Reading the Ordinance declaring
unopposedcandidatesfor Wards NumberFive (5) and Six (6) in the May 07, 2005 GeneralCity
Election, electedto office; cancelingthe election;providing a severabilityclause,andproviding an
effectivedate. CouncilmemberDennisRobertsonsecondedthemotion. A unanimousaffirmativevote
wasrecorded.

NEW BUSINESS:

5. PRESENTATION BY AXLEY & RODE, LLP AND THE FINANCE COMMITTEE
CONCERNING THE FY2005COMPREHENSIVE ANNUAL FINANCIAL REPORT



MayorLouis Bronaughstatedthat the next item was a presentationby Axley & Rode, LLP and the
FinanceCommitteeconcerningthe FY2005ComprehensiveAnnual FinancialReport. City Manager
PaulParkeraskedthe Axley & Rode,LLP representativeto statehis name,firm nameandthen the
auditreportfor therecord.

Eric Carver, the auditor in charge, with Axley & Rode, LLP introducedhimself along with Linda
Milford, also with Axley & Rode,LLP. Mr. Carverexplainedthat Ms. Milford was thepartnerin
charge of the audit this year. Mr. Carver explainedthat he would highlight the reportas a more
detailed explanationwas given to the FinanceCommitteeearlier that day. Mr. Carver statedthat
Axley & Rode,LLP was issuinga clean andunqualifiedopinion, which is the highestopinion that
could be assessed. Mr. Carver addedthat Axley andRode’s opinion is the FinancialStatements
present,in all materialrespects,the respectivefinancialposition of the governmentalactivities, the
business-typeactivities,eachmajorfund, andthe aggregateremainingfund information of theCity of
Lufkin, Texasas of September30, 2004, andthe respectivechangesin financialposition andcash
flows, whereapplicable,thereoffor theyear endedin conformity with accountingprinciplesgenerally
acceptedin theUnitedStatesof America.

Mr. Carverexplainedthat includedin thereportwas the management’sdiscussionandanalysisthat
waspreparedby the managementof the City of Lufkin. Mr. Carver addedthat Axley andRode
reviewstheinformation to makesurethat it is in agreementwith thefinancial information andadded
that thereportis consolidatedinto a five or six pageformatthat discussesthe pastandfuture andhas
some comparative information that is not available in other forms of the report. Mr. Carver
encouragedthe Council to readthe report. Mr. Carverpointed out the financial statementsto the
Council. Mr. Carverexplainedthat financial statementsthat take all of the funds of the City and
consolidatetheminto a singlestatementformatcouldbe foundon pagestwenty-three(23)andtwenty-
four (24) of the report. Mr. Carver addedthat the fund level statementscould be found on pages
twenty-five (25) and twenty-six (26) of the report. Mr. Carver explained that the “Notes to the
Financial Statements”could be found beginning on page forty-one (41) and that there were no
significant changesto the notesthan on prior years with the exceptionof pagesixty-one (61). Mr.
Parkerpointed out in the subsequenteventsthe citizens of Lufkin voted to createa 4B economic
developmentcorporation(EDC) effective October 1, 2004. Mr. Carver also pointed out that on
December21, 2004,the City of Lufkin issued$8,200,000of certificatesof obligationbondsto finance
street, drainage,water and sewer lines as part of the City of Lufkin’s 1999 CapitalImprovement
Program.

Mr. Carverstatedthat beginningon pagesixty-nine (69) that Council would find the disaggregated
individual fund information. Mr. Carverexplainedthat this would bewhatCouncil would utilize for
budgetarypurposes,planningand themanagementof the City of Lufkin. Mr. Carveraddedthat on
pageonehundredfifteen (115) that Council would find thereportsof complianceof internalcontrols
andcomplianceregardingfederalprograms. Mr. Carverexplainedthat as a resultof their testingthat
Axley andRodefound no instancesof non-compliancethat are requiredto be reported. Mr. Carver
explainedthat therewere some internal control items that were pointed out to staff, but were not
consideredto be materialweaknesses.Mr. Carverexplainedthat thesewere some opportunitiesto
improvesomecontrolsin theCity.

Mr. Carverstatedthat in the majorprogramand internalcontrol over compliance,Axley andRode
foundno problemswith anyof the federalprogramsthatwereexamined.Mr. Carveraddedthat Axley
andRodeappreciatedtheopportunityto work with theCity of Lufkin andtheFinanceDepartmentand
thankedthemfor their cooperation.

Mayor Bronaughthen calledon the FinanceCommitteefor their report. City ManagerPaulParker
was appointedto give the report. City ManagerParker statedthat the FinanceCommitteewent
throughtheauditwith Axley andRodewith considerabledetail. City ManagerParkeraddedthat there
were two items concerningbank reconciliation and property and equipment records that were
addressedin the letter andwould beresolvedin the future. City ManagerParkerhighlightedthat one
item that the Council andStaff needsto concentrateon in thebudgetprocessthis yearwould be the
Civic CenterFund. City ManagerParkeraddedthat theCivic CenterFundcunentlycarriesa balance
of a little lessthan $5,000and if the City continuesto contributethe sameratio to entities,the fund
would require supplementationby the GeneralFund. City ManagerParker addedthat possiblythe
Council should appoint a couple of members to look at the Civic Center Fund and make
recommendationsfor the future of this fund beforethe budgetprocessis completed. City Manager
Parkerexplainedthat thesewerethe itemsthat the FinanceCommitteewantedto highlight andadded
that as Eric Carverhadpreviouslyexplained,the City of Lufkin is in good shapeas far as financials,
reportingandrecords.

6. PRESENTATION BY KEITH WRIGHT. CITY ENGINEER CONCERNING THE
DOWNTOWN STREET OVERLAY PROJECT

MayorLouis Bronaughstatedthat thenextitemfor considerationwasa presentationby Keith Wright,
City Engineer,concerningtheDowntownStreetOverlayProject.



City EngineerKeith Wright explainedthat Council had requestedat thelastCouncil meeting to be
broughtup to dateon theDowntownProject. Mr. Wright explainedthat Council would havebefore
them the financial report and also a map showingwhat has been completed, what is still under
constructionandwhatremainsto be started. Mr. Wright then explainedthechartthatCouncilhadat
their respectiveplaces.

Mr. Wright statedthat the GeneralFund Contingency Fund would continue to drop due to the
conditionsin the field. Mr. Wright addedthat on almosteverystreetthat hadbeenconstructed,there
hadbeensub-gradeproblems. Mr. Wright explainedthat the asphaltpricehas increaseddue to some
of theparkinglot anddrivewaytie-ins thatwere not includedin theoriginal estimates.

Mr. Wright statedthatbasedon what hadbeencompletedto date,the engineersexpect the City of
Lufkin to be approximately$100,000short at the endof theproject. Mr. Wright explainedthat he
thinks that theCity canfinish theprojectwith the contingencythat is left. Mr. Wright addedthat the
City has madechangesin thewaythey arehandling thesub-gradeandare discussingtheprocesswith
thecontractor.

Mr. Wright thenexplainedthemapandwent overthestreetsto clarify whathadbeencompleted,what
is underconstructionandthe areasthat havenot currently beenstarted. Mr. Wright thenpresenteda
slide show to familiarize the Council with the streets in the downtown areaat this point in the
constructionprocess.

Mr. Wright statedthatthephasingplanhadbeenchangeddueto how theutilities aretied in andas the
City movesaroundto accommodatethedifferentbusinessesconcerns.Mr. Wright explainedthatFirst
Streetwould be the last streetfor the reconstructionproject. Mr. Wright statedthat the expected
completiondatewould be approximatelyMarch2006.

CouncilmemberDon Langstonaskedwhat percentageis currentlycompleted. Mr. Wright statedthat
basedon moneypaidout; the completionis at seventy-fourpercent(74%). CouncilmemberLangston
askedif theCity’s portionof theworkis calculatedinto thereport. Mr. Wrightexplainedthat only the
materialsareincluded.

7. BIDS FOR A DVR RECORDING SURVEILLANCE SYSTEM - APPROVED - FOR THE
POLICE DEPARTMENT

MayorLouis Bronaughstatedthat the next itemfor considerationwas awardingthe bid for a DVR
RecordingSurveillanceSystemfor thePoliceDepartment.City ManagerParkerstatedthat this DVR
RecordingSurveillanceSystemwould upgradethe ability in thePolice Departmentfor surveillancein
theCity Hall, Police Department,andsurroundingparking lots. City ManagerParkerexplainedthat
this systemwould display andrecordexistingvideo cameraactivity and the upgradewill be funded
throughthe Municipal Court SecurityFund. City ManagerParkeraddedthat the low bidder is DP
Solutionsof Lufkin, Texasin theamountof $17,823and that Staffrecommendstheawardof contract
to DP Solutionsof Lufkin, Texas.

CouncilmemberRose Fame Boyd moved to approve awarding the bid for a DVR Recording
SurveillanceSystemfor thePoliceDepartment.CouncilmemberLynn Tonessecondedthemotion. A
unanimousaffirmativevotewasrecorded.

8. BIDS FOR THE INSTALLATION OF A 200 KW GENERATOR - APPROVED - FOR THE
POLICE DEPARTMENT

Mayor Louis Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas awarding of the bid for the
installationof a 200 kw Generatorfor the Police Department. City ManagerPaulParkerstatedthat
theCouncil had recentlyawardedthebid for the purchaseof this generatorandthat this bid would be
for the installationof the generator. City ManagerParkeraddedthat the low bidderwas Weisinger
Electric, Inc. in the amount of $18,663and that Staff recommendedthat Council awardthe bid to
WeisingerElectric, Inc.

CouncilmemberDon Langstonaskedhow the City was doing with the funds for HomelandSecurity.
CouncilmemberLangstonaskedif thefunds werealmostspentor if therewas still money in thefund.
Public Works Director KennethWilliams explainedthat therewas still money in the Homeland
SecurityGrantFunds. Mr. Williams addedthat the City Staff had recentlypurchasedsome smaller
generatorsthatwould be usedfor the IT Departmentandhavealsopurchasedsomeitemsfor theFire
Department.Mr. Williams statedthat thereare funds beingset asidefor equipmentfor the proposed
EmergencyOperationsCenter. Mr. Williams addedthat the City of Lufkin had originally been
awardedabout$200,000in this grantandhavecurrentlyspentaboutone-half(1/2) of that amount.

CouncilmemberLynn Tonesmovedto approveawardingthe bid to WeisingerElectric, Inc. for the
installation of a 200 kw Generatorfor the Police Department. CouncilmemberDon Langston
secondedthe motion. A unanimousaffirmativevote wasrecorded.



9. BID FOR THE PURCHASE OF THREE (3)¾TON UTILITY TRUCKS AND ONE (1) ~/2 TON
PICKUP - APPROVED - FOR THE WATER DISTRIBUTION DEPARTMENT

Mayor Louis Bronaugh statedthat the next item for considerationwas awarding the bid for the
purchaseof three(3) ¾Ton Utility Trucks andOne (1) ½Ton,Pickupfor the WaterDistribution
Department.City ManagerParkerstatedthat thenext two itemshadthe sameexplanationanddollar
amountsfor thepurchaseof theutility andpickuptrucks. City ManagerParkerexplainedthat theonly
differencewas they werefor two separatedepartments.City ManagerParkeraddedthat thesetrucks
were all budgeted in the 2004/2005Budget and could be purchasedthrough the Texas Local
GovernmentPurchasingCooperativeor HGAC. City ManagerParker explainedthat thebid for the
three(3) ¾ton Utility Truckswould be $65,103.78andtheone(1)½tonpickupwould be$17,328.00
andwerebudgetedin theCity’s ReplacementFund.

CouncilmemberDon Langstonaskedif the City of Lufkin has a vehiclereplacementpolicy. City
ManagerParkerexplainedthat the City has a policy, but addedthat dueto the budgetconstraintsthe
City hadpostponedthepurchaseof severalvehicles. City ManagerParkerstatedthat dueto thehigh
costsof repair andtheageof someof thecurrentvehiclestheStafffelt it wasnow timeto replacethem
andshouldhelp the City get backon schedulefor the replacementof vehicles. City ManagerParker
addedthat whenevera vehicleis replacedit may possiblybemovedto anotherdepartmentif thereis
some value left in the vehicle. City ManagerParkerexplainedthat if this occurs thereis an older
vehicleremovedfrom that departmentso thedepartmentdoesnot continuouslygrow its fleet. City
Manager Parker addedthat any vehicles that are removedare then auctioned. Councilmember
Langstonaskedfora copyof this policy.

CoundilmemberDennis Robertsonasked about the funding of these vehicles. Councilmember
Robertsonaddedthat the memoreflectedthat the funding would be from the City’s GeneralFund.
City ManagerParkerstatedthat this was a typo and that thesevehicleswould be coming out of the
Utility VehicleReplacementFund. Mr. Parkerexplainedthat this mistakewould becorrected.

CouncilmemberDennisRobertsonmovedto approveawardingthebid to HGAC for the purchaseof
three(3) ¾Ton Utility Trucks andOne (1) ½Ton Pickup for the WaterDistribution Department.
CouncilmemberRoseFameBoydsecondedthemotion. A unanimousaffirmativevote wasrecorded.

10. BID FOR THE PURCHASE OF THREE (3) ¾TON UTILITY TRUCKS AND ONE (1) ½TON
PICKUP - APPROVED - FOR THE SEWER REHAB DEPARTMENT

Mayor Louis Bronaugh statedthat the next item for considerationwas awarding the bid for the
purchaseof three (3) ¾Ton Utility Trucks and One (1) ½Ton Pickup for the Sewer Rehab
Department.CityManagerParkerstatedashejustpreviouslyexplained,thesevehiclesareatthe same
priceand sameexplanationas the previous trucksandwould come out of the Utility Depreciation
Fund.

CouncilmemberLynn Tonesmovedto approveawardingthe bid for thepurchaseof three(3) ¾Ton
Utility TrucksandOne(1)½Ton Pickupfor the SewerRehabDepartment. CouncilmemberDennis
Robertsonsecondedthemotion. A unanimousaffirmativevote wasrecorded.

11. BID FOR THE RECONSTRUCTION OF SIX (6) DRWEWAY APPROACHES.APRONS

,

AND PORTIONS OF DRIVEWAYS AT 327, 402,425, 429,433, AND 601 MARTIN LUTHER
KING DRIVE AND A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING AN AMENDMENT TO THE 2004/2005
OPERATING BUDGET (BUDGET AMENDMENT NO. 15), - APPROVED - PROVIDING
FOR THE SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRIATION OF FUNDS IN THE GENERAL STREET
CONSTRUCTION FUND; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE

Mayor Louis Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas awarding the bid for the
reconstructionof Six (6) Driveway Approaches,Aprons,andPortionsof Driveways at 327,402, 425,
429, 433, and 601 Martin Luther King Drive and a Resolution authorizingan Amendmentto the
2004/2005 Operating Budget (Budget Amendment No. 15), providing for the supplemental
appropriationof funds in the GeneralStreetConstructionFund; andproviding an effectivedate. City
ManagerPaulParkerstatedthatthis is thesecondphaseof thedrivewayreplacementon Martin Luther
King Drive. City ManagerParkerexplainedthatwhentheCity preparedthebudgetlast year,the City
thoughttherewere four (4) drivewaysneedingrepair and the numbergrew to six (6). City Manager
Parkerstatedthat Staffrecommendedawardingthe bid to Slabson Grade,Inc. for $21,610andadded
that would include the transfer of $14,500from the ColumbineDrainageProject to complete the
project.

CouncilmemberDon Langstoncommentedthat he was under the impressionthat last year the City
would replacethree(3) driveways. City ManagerParkerexplainedthat therewerethree(3) driveways
repairedin last year’sbudgetandfour (4) appropriatedfor in this year’sbudget,but the numberthen
grewto six (6) driveways. City ManagerParkeraddedthat thenumbercouldstill growas citizenssee
their neighbor’s drivewaysbeing repairedand begin to complain. CouncilmemberDon Langston
asked where the additional money would be used that is stated in the Resolution request.



CouncilmemberLangstonstatedthat thebid wasfor $21,610andthe Resolutionstatedthat the budget
would beincreasedfrom $13,000to $36,250. CouncilmemberLangstonaskedfor the explanationof
thedifferencein thesetwo amounts. CouncilmemberLangstonalsoaskedfor Staffto also identify the
engineeringfees for thisproject.

Mayor Louis Bronaughrequestedthat Staff researchthis information and theitem be delayedto later
in theCouncilmeeting.

12. AUTHORIZED STAFF TO APPLY FOR THE 2005FIREACT GRANT - APPROVED - FOR
FIREFIGHTER SAFETY AND ACCOUNTABILITY EQUIPMENT

MayorLouis Bronaughstatedthat thenext itemfor considerationwas to authorizeStaff to apply for
the 2005 FIREACT Grant for firefighter safetyandaccountabilityequipment. City ManagerPaul
Parker statedthat the Fire Departmentwas askingCouncil to approvethe application for the 2005
FIREACTGrantin the amountof $145,950. City ManagerParkerexplainedthat theCity’s tenpercent
(10%) match would be $14,595 and could be obtained from funds within the Fire Department
OperationalBudgetwithouthavingto appropriateadditionaldollars.

CouncilmemberLynn Tones moved to authorize Staff to apply for the 2005 FIREACT Grantfor
firefighter safety and accountabilityequipment. CouncilmemberRose Fame Boyd secondedthe
motion. A unanimousaffirmativevotewasrecorded.

13. AUTHORIZED WORKING CAPITAL ADVANCE - APPROVED - FOR THE TEXAS CIVIC
CENTER FUND (HOTEL/MOTEL FUND)

MayorLouis Bronaughstatedthat the next itemfor considerationwas to considera WorkingCapital
Advancefor the TexasCivic CenterFund(Hotel/Motel Fund). City ManagerPaulParkerstatedthat
theCivic CenterFundhasbeenhavingcashflow issuesin recentmonths. City ManagerParkeradded
that the City receivesquarterlypaymentsfrom the Hotel/Motel Tax Fundbut someof themoney is
paidto certainentitiesat the beginningof thequarterwhile the moneyis beingreceivedby theCity at
the endof thequarter. City ManagerParkerexplainedthat this advancewould not needadditional
funds for the Civic CenterFundbut simply allow theCity to utilize up to $75,000to assistwith the
cashflow in this fund.

CouncilmemberDennisRobertsonstatedthat during theFinanceCommitteemeetingit wasdiscussed
that the Civic CenterFundmay be inappropriatelynamedthe “Civic CenterFund” due to several
entitiesdrawingmoneyfrom the fund. CouncilmemberRobertsonsuggestedthat Council consider
renamingthe fund and also consider the distribution of the money. CouncilmemberRobertson
suggestedthatCouncilshouldpossiblygive adviceto theLufkin Boardof Developmentabouthowthe
moneywould be distributedandconsiderutilizing the GeneralFund if neededto subsidizethe Civic
Center Fund. CouncilmemberDon Langston suggestedthat the Civic Center should be self-
supporting,while realizingthat this is a difficult goal to achieve. City ManagerParkerstatedthat most
Centerssuchas theCivic Centerhaveto besubsidizedandaddedthat the rentalsfrom theCivic Center
would notsupporttheneededmaintenancefor thefacility.

CouncilmemberDon Langstonmovedto authorizea WorkingCapitalAdvancefor the TexasCivic
Center Fund (Hotel/Motel Fund). CouncilmemberDennis Robertsonsecondedthe motion. A
unanimousaffirmativevotewasrecorded.

14. RESOLUTION OF SUPPORTOF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LUFKIN, TEXAS
AUTHORIZING SUBMISSION OF AN APPLICATION TO THE TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF
HOUSING AND COMMUNITY AFFAIRS FOR HOME INVESTMENT PARTNERSHIPS
PROGRAM FUNDS; - APPROVED - AND AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ACT AS THE
CITY’S CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER AND AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE IN ALL
MATTERS PERTAINING TO THE CITY’S PARTICIPATION IN THE PROGRAM

MayorLouis Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas a Resolutionof Supportof the
City Council of the City of Lufkin, Texasauthorizing submissionof an application to the Texas
Departmentof Housingand CommunityAffairs for HomeInvestmentPartnershipsProgramFunds;
andauthorizingtheMayorto actas theCity’s Chief ExecutiveOfficer andauthorizedrepresentativein
all matterspertainingto the City’s participationin theProgram. City ManagerPaulParkerstatedthat
this is a requestto apply to the TexasDepartmentof HousingandCommunityAffairs 2005 HOME
GrantProgram. City ManagerParkeraddedthat this Resolutionwould befor matchingfunds in the
amount of $62,500thathas beenappropriatedin the currentbudget. CouncilmemberDon Langston
askedif the City Staff was asking for $62,500in matchingfunds and an additional$62,500for cash
reserve. InspectionDepartmentemployeeKara Atwood explainedthat the $62,500for cashreserve
would beforcashflow purposesandwould notbean additionalamountneededin therequest.

CouncilmemberDennisRobertsonmovedto approvea Resolutionof Supportof the City Council of
the City of Lufkin, Texas authorizingsubmissionof an application to the TexasDepartmentof
Housingand CommunityAffairs for Home InvestmentPartnershipsProgramFunds; and authorizing
the Mayor to act as the City’s Chief ExecutiveOfficer andauthorizedrepresentativein all matters



pertainingto the City’s participationin the Program. CouncilmemberR. L. Kuykendallsecondedthe
motion. A unanimousaffirmativevotewasrecorded.

15. RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING AN AMENDMENT TO THE 2004/2005 OPERATING
BUDGET (BUDGET AMENDMENT NO. 16). - APPROVED - PROVIDING FOR THE
SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRIATION OF FUNDS IN THE GENERAL FUND; AND
PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE. THIS BUDGET ADJUSTMENT IS FOR USE AT
KIWANIS PARK FOR AN ENHANCEMENT PROJECTAS A RESULT OF THE DONATION
FROM THE COMMUNITY’S CINCO DEMAYO

Mayor Louis Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas a Resolutionauthorizingan
Amendmentto the 2004/2005OperatingBudget (Budget AmendmentNo. 16), providing for the
supplementalappropriationof fundsin theGeneralFund; andprovidingan effectivedate. ThisBudget
Adjustmentis for useat Kiwanis Parkfor an enhancementprojectasa resultof thedonationfrom the
Community’sCinco deMayo. City ManagerPaulParkerstatedthat this Resolutionwould allowCity
Staff to acceptthe donationof $1,000to be usedat Kiwanis Parkfor anenhancementproject. City
ManagerParkeraddedthatthis would basicallybemoneyin andthenmoneyoutandthat this donation
would beappropriatedin nextyear’sbudget.

CouncilmemberRoseFameBoydmovedto approvetheResolutionauthorizingan Amendmentto the
2004/2005 Operating Budget (Budget Amendment No. 16), providing for the supplemental
appropriationof funds in the GeneralFund; andproviding an effectivedate.CouncilmemberDennis
Robertsonsecondedthemotion. A unanimousaffirmativevote wasrecorded.

16. FIRST READING OF AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING MAXIMUM SPEEDS OF MOTOR
VEHICLES - APPROVED - IN CERTAIN AREAS AS DESIGNATED ON FM HIGHWAY 819

Mayor Louis Bronaugh statedthat the next item for considerationwas the First Reading of an
Ordinanceestablishingmaximum speedsof motor vehiclesin certain areasas designatedon FM
Highway 819. City ManagerPaulParker statedthat this itemwas initiated by AngelinaCollegeto
slow the traffic on FIvI 819. City Manager Parker explained that the Texas Department of
TransportationstudiedtheproposalandrecommendedthatCouncilmakethechangesasrecommended
by TXDOT. City ManagerParkeraddedthat themajor changewill beto reducethe speedlimit near
the Collegefrom fifty (50) miles per hour to forty-five (45) miles per hour. City ManagerParker
stated that Staff reviewedthe requestand recommendationsand proposesCouncil approve the
Ordinancereducingspeedlimits on CollegeDrive (FM 819).

CouncilmemberDon Langstonaskedif theHighway Departmentprovideda traffic studyto City staff
showing thepurposefor decreasingthe speedlimit by five (5) miles per hour. City EngineerKeith
Wright explained that the request came from Angelina College but Texas Department of
TransportationhadnotprovidedtheCity with a traffic study. City ManagerParkerreiteratedthat this
wasa resultof therequestfrom AngelinaCollege.

CouncilmemberRoseFameBoyd movedto approveon First Readingof an Ordinanceestablishing
maximum speeds of motor vehicles in certain areas as designatedon FM Highway 819.
CouncilmemberDennisRobertsonsecondedthemotion. A unanimousaffirmativevote wasrecorded.

17. BID FOR THE RECONSTRUCTION OF SIX (6) DRIVEWAY APPROACHES, APRONS

,

AND PORTIONS OF DRIVEWAYS AT 327, 402,425, 429,433, AND 601 MARTIN LUTHER
KING DRIVE AND A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING AN AMENDMENT TO THE 2004/2005
OPERATING BUDGET (BUDGET AMENDMENT NO. 15), - APPROVED - PROVIDING
FOR THE SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRIATION OF FUNDS IN THE GENERAL STREET
CONSTRUCTION FUND; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE

Mayor Louis Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas to go back to item number
eleven(no. 11) on theagenda.Mayor Bronaughexplainedthat this was for awardingthe bid for the
reconstructionof six (6) drivewayson Martin LutherKing Drive. City ManagerPaulParkercalledon
AccountingDirectorDougWoodto explaintheprocess.

AccountingDirectorDougWoodexplainedthatthis is a constructionfund thatcrossesmultiple years.
Mr. Wood statedthat during the 2004/2005BudgetYear therewas $12,750carried over from the
2003/2004Budget. Mr. Wood addedthat StevePoskeyhadbudgetedadditional funding of $10,500
that would bring the fund to $23,250. Mr. Wood explainedthat Mr. Poskeyhas spent a total of
$13,651.16on completeddrivewaysthat would leavea balanceof approximately$9,600. Mr. Wood
statedthat the additional$13,000to the residualbalancewould leave$22,598for the remainingwork
that needsto be done. Mr. Wood then explainedthat a balanceof $5,250 was carriedover for
engineeringservices.Mr. Woodaddedthat thetotalengineeringcostwas $6,750,leavingtheneedfor
theadditional$1,500.

CouncilmemberR. L. Kuykendallmovedto approveawardingthebid for the reconstructionof Six (6)
DrivewayApproaches,Aprons,andPortionsof Drivewaysat 327, 402, 425, 429, 433, and601 Martin
Luther King Drive anda Resolutionauthorizingan Amendmentto the 2004/2005OperatingBudget



(BudgetAmendmentNo. 15), providingfor the supplementalappropriationof funds in the General
Street ConstructionFund; and providing an effective date. CouncilmemberDennis Robertson
secondedthemotion. A unanimousaffirmative votewas recorded.

18. MayorLouisBronaughrecessedtheRegularSessionat6:05p.m. to enterinto ExecutiveSession.

EXECUTIVE SESSION: In accordancewith the Texas GovernmentCode Section 551.071 (2)
Consultation with City Attorney on any Regular Session Agenda item requiring confidential,
attorney/clientadvicesnecessitatedby thedeliberationor discussionof saiditems(as needed),andreal
estateandpersonnelmaybediscussed.

MayorLouis BronaughreconvenedtheRegularSessionat 7:27p.m.

19. APPOINTMENT TO 4-B ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT BOARD

MayorLouisBronaughstatedthat thenextitem for considerationwasto appointrepresentativesto the
4-B EconomicDevelopmentBoard. CouncilmemberLynn Tonesmovedto appointBob Brown to
serve on the 4-B EconomicDevelopmentBoard to fill theremainingterm of Bob Leslie and to re-
appointMayor Louis Bronaugh,JackGorden, and Don Langstonto serve a two year term on the
Board. CouncilmemberR. L. Kuykendallsecondedthe motion. A unanimousaffirmative vote was
recorded.

20. City ManagerPaulParkerremindedCouncilthat their “calendarof events”was attheir places.

21. Therebeingno furtherbusinessfor consideration,the meetingadjournedat 7:29p.m.

~

ATTEST

(ReneeThompson— C~4~Secretary


