
MINUTES OF REGULAR MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
LUFKIN. TEXAS. HELD ON THE

17TH DAY OF MARCH. 1998AT 5:00P. M

.

On the 17th day of March, 1998 the City Council of the City of Lufkin, Texas,
convenedin a regular meeting in the Council Chambersof City Hall with the
following membersthereof, to wit:

Louis Bronaugh
Don Boyd
PercySimond
Betty Jones
Bob Bowman
JackGorden,Jr.
Tucker Weems
C. G. Maclin
Bob Flournoy
Atha Stokes
Keith Wright
Kenneth Williams

Mayor
Mayorpro tern
Councilmember,
Councilmember,
Councilmember,
Councilmember,
Councilmember,
City Manager
City Attorney
City Secretary
City Engineer
Director of Public Works

WardNo. 2
Ward No. 3
Ward No. 4
Ward No. 5
Ward No. 6

beingpresentwhen the following businesswas transacted.

1. Meeting wasopenedwith prayerby Rev. Jeff Robinson,Minister, Southside

BaptistChurch.

2. Mayor Bronaughwelcomedvisitors present.

3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES

Motion was made by Councilmember Don Boyd
CouncilmemberJack Gorden,Jr. that the minutes of
February18, 1998 andthe Regular Meeting of March3,
presented. A unanimousaffirmativevotewasrecorded.

and secondedby
the Called Meeting of

1998 be approvedas

4. PRESENTATION OF RECENT CONSTRUCTION AT WASTE WATER
TREATMENT PLANT

Bobby Mott, WasteWaterTreatmentPlantSuperintendent,narrateda brief video of
the recentconstructionat theWasteWaterTreatmentPlant.

5. ORDINANCE - DENIED - FIRST READING - ZONECHANGE - RESIDENTIAL
MEDIUM SINGLE FAMILY TO LOCAL BUSINESS - OAKLAND ADDITION

-

FRANK AVENUE - MOORE AVENUE - A. L. HARGRAVES - JEAN McVICKER

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas requestof A. L.
Hargraves on behalf of JeanMcVicker et al. to changethe zoning from “RM”
ResidentialMedium SingleFamily to “LB” Local Businesson Lots 4 and5 of Block 3
of theOaklandAddition (generallylocatedon Moore Avenueeastof BynumStreet)
and the vacatedalley betweenFrankAvenue andMoore Avenueextendingfrom
Bynum to BledsoeStreet.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat includedin theCouncil packetis a memorandum
of explanationfrom he PlanningDepartmentand a recommendationfor approval
by thePlanning& Zoning Commission.

Bruce Shelby, the developerof the property, stated that the property will be
developedfor an Eckerd’s drugstoreand will be similar to the new Eckerd’s at
Lufkin AvenueandTimberlandDrive. Mr. Shelbystatedthatthepropertyconsists
of nine lots, two of whicharezonedResidential. Mr. Shelbystatedthatthe reason
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he was presentwas to discussthe zone changefor the two Residentiallots to
Commerciallots. Mr. Shelbystatedthat all of the frontagealongFrankAvenueis
Commercialbut the two lots on Moore Streetare zonedResidential. Mr. Shelby
statedthat thepropertyon the front now hasa Texacostationand The Spud. Mr.
Shelbystatedthat it washis intent to removethe undergroundstoragetanks from
the servicestationand completelyredevelopthe property and hopefullymake it
look like theotherEckerd’sstore. Mr. Shelbystatedthat as a developerhebuilds
thestoreandthenleasesit to Eckerd’s. Mr. Shelbystatedthat thiswill actuallybe a
relocationof the Eckerd’sstorein GaslightPlaza. (Mr. Shelbypassedout a copyof
the site plan to Councilmembers.)

Toni Medina,who, lives at 906 Moore Street,statedthat she is opposedto this
request. Mrs. Medinastatedthatasa long time residentandtaxpayerof Lufkin she
finds it difficult to believe that outsiderscan come in and ultimately affect her
family by compromisingher families homeand safetyto build a business. Mrs.
Medina stated that she was sure that there were many other sites just as
accommodatingand less compromisingin this areaof Lufkin in which to build
anotherbusiness. Mrs. Medinastatedthatthe ShelbyDevelopmentGrouphasnot
once approachedthem or shownan interestin their property,andthey will be the
oneswho are ultimately affected. (The only residentsliving directly besideand
behindthisbuilding.) Mrs. Medinastatedthatnow they areleft with a restriction
andthe only way to sell their property is to rely on their neighborwho is the only
other residenton that block now if this zonechangegoesthrough. Mrs. Medina
statedthat shedid not feel like they shouldhaveto rely on anotherparty to beable
to sell their home and their property. Mrs. Medina statedthat she does
understandthat ShelbyDevelopmentshouldnotbe forced to buy theirpropertyand
by thesametokenshefeelsthatthey shouldnotbe forced on them.

JessieMedina statedthat he would like to read a statement: “When Shelby
Developmentcamein theCity Council nor thePlanning& Zoning put any kind of
restriction saying you’ve got to do this in order to get this measureapproved.
Likewise, I feel as a resultof approvingthis no restrictionshouldbe forcedupon the
residentsthat remain. My issueherehasnot beenthat the ComprehensivePlan
saysthis is goingto beafuturenon-residentialsite. It hasa little bit to do with that,
butnot totally. The issuehere is that the restrictionsarebeingput on me. Last
weekMr. Shelbystoodup andsaidthe reasonhe purchasedthelot on thebackside
of Moore Streetis thatthepropertiesrun 150’ deepandyou can’tbuild muchon a
150’ depth. My property runs 140’, 50 I’m sureI can’t build anything on there
either commercialwise~ So I cannotsell my property by itself ascommercial. I
don’t see anyway to sell it residential,becausenobodywantsit plus it is a future
non-residentialsite accordingto the ComprehensivePlan. So the whole agenda
here is basedon thatrestriction. That restrictionbasicallysaysthatin order for me
to sell my homea few thingshaveto happen. And I don’t think anybodiesrights
will be violated if thesetwo conditionsarebeingmet. One, I haveto hopethat
somebodycomesin with a good heartandwants to setup businesson the Moore
sideof the street. That’s the first thing thathasto happen. Thesecondthing that
hasto happenis thathe hasgot to dependon theneighboron the right sideof him,
as you arefacing Moore Street,his willingness to sell his property in conjunction
with mine. Thesetwo conditionshaveto be met. I havea family of six now,
recentlywe just had twins. I live in a two bedroomhome. I was planningon
addingon before all this took place. That’sno longercost effective. Now my
dilemma is to getanotherhouse. But if I have to wait for somebodyto come and
buymy house,or if I’ve got to wait for my neighborto sell his property,I cannotget
rid of my property to buy anotherhouse. I don’t havemoneyin thebank for a
downpaymenton anotherhouseandstill maintainahouseon Moore Street. The
whole issueis thata restrictionis beingplacedon me. It maynot comeout in black
andwhite,but morally thatrestrictionis being appliedto me. I would alsolike to
sayasa formerU. S. MarineI believein honestyandintegrity andfighting for what
I believe in. I stand firm in my opposition to the proposedEckerd’s site as
previouslystated. Right is right andwrong is wrong. And I feel thatthePlanning
& Zoning Committeewas wrong in allowing Shelby DevelopmentCompanyto
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divide my block in an unevenproportion. This is thewhole issuehere,this is how
it all started. Not thatthey camein andboughttheproperty,but theway thatthey
boughtit. I alsofeelthat asMr. Castleberrytried to point out lastweek if Mantooth
which is alsoadjoinedto local businesseson FrankStreetis permittedto maintain
its statusasresidential,why notMoore. I want to go aheadandthankyou, I know
that this is a hard decision,but I want to thankeachand everyonefor your time
and considerationin this matter.”

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberGorden,City ManagerMaclin statedthat
at theP&Z meetingMr. Shelby indicatedthat they didn’t haveto have the second
lot that would be due north of Mr. Medina’s property, and would probably
landscapethis lot.

Mr. Shelbystatedthat The Spudrestaurantis on thesecondlot andthey wantedto
remove all the improvementsso there would be clean,open accessalong Frank
Street. Mr. Shelbystatedthat lot will be usedfor landscapingasshownon thesite
plan.

CouncilmemberGordenstatedthat hepersonallysaw this is adilemma.

Mr. Shelby stated that he certainly appreciatesand understandsthe Medina’s
concernand as a part of the regularrequirementshe will have to do screening
betweenhis property,whichwill be commercialandresidential. Mr. Shelbystated
that he will screeneverythingon the eastsideof their propertyso that it will not
affectthe residentialuseof theMedinas.

CouncilmemberSimondstatedthat, in his opinion,anyonethat would be opposed
to this would be “spitting againstthe wind”. CouncilmemberSimond askedif
anyonehadeverappraisedthe Medina’s property. Mayor Bronaughstatedthatthe
propertyhadnotbeenappraised. City ManagerMaclin statedthatthealley that is
contiguousto Mr. Medina’spropertyhadbeenappraisedat $3 persquarefoot, which
would be his northernboundary. In responseto questionby Councilmember
Simond,City ManagerMaclin statedthat Mr. Lyons statedin his appraisalthat he
appraisedthealley asif it werea lot on FrankStreetsothatbasicallyheis indicating
thatthevalue of propertyalongFrankStreetis at $3 persquarefoot. In responseto
questionby CouncilmemberSimond,City ManagerMaclin statedthe sale of the
alley was addressedby Council a month ago. City ManagerMaclin statedthat
Council approvedthesaleif thebuyerchoseto purchaseit. City AttorneyFloumoy
statedthat the alley hasbeenclosedby Ordinanceandauthorizedthat it be sold at
fair marketvalue to theadjoining owners,andthe Medinaswould havea right to
purchasehalf of thealley thatlies behindtheir property.

Mrs. Medina statedthat the lot besideher property that was purchasedby Mr.
Shelby has the exactsamefootage,the exact samedimensionsas her lot. Mrs.
Medinastatedthat shedid not know how muchMr. Shelbypaid for the property.
Mrs. Medina stated that her lot was 7,000 sq. ft., 50’ frontage, 140’ depth.
CouncilmemberSimond statedthat basically this is $21,000, and Eckerd’s is too
cheapto pay thesepeople$21,000. Mr. Flournoystatedthat $21,000is for the land
andtheMedina’s propertyhasahouseon it. CouncilmemberSimondstatedthat
he is disturbedthat when it comesto businessversuspeoplewe alwayslean to the
side of the business,and if there were no people there would be no business.
CouncilmemberSimondstatedthat he did not know why “we couldnot get it in
our heads”that we cannotlet thesecompaniescomein andcontroltheCity without
taking underconsiderationthat we aredisplacingsomepeople. Mr. Shelbystated
that Eckerd’s is not purchasingthe property, this is two individuals buying the
property and signing a leasewith Eckerd’s. Mr. Shelby statedthat he is already
purchasingproperty on Frank whereThe Spudrestaurantis that he doesnotneed
aspart of thedevelopment.

Motion was made by Councilmember Percy Simond and seconded by
Councilmember Betty Jones that Ordinance for zone change request from
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ResidentialMedium Single Family to Local Businesson Lots 4 and 5 of Block 3 of
the Oakland Addition (generallylocatedon Moore Avenueeastof Bynum Street)
and the vacatedalley betweenFrankAvenueand Moore Avenueextendingfrom
Bynum to BledsoeStreetbe denied. Thefollowing votewasrecorded:

Aye: CouncilmembersSimondand Jones
Nay: CouncilmembersBowman,Weems,Boyd, Gordenand Mayor Bronaugh

Motion failed with a 5 to 2 vote.

Motion was madeby CouncilmemberDon Boyd and secondedby Councilmember
Bob Bowmanthat.Ordinancefor zone changerequestfrom ResidentialMedium
Single Family to Local Businesson Lots 4 and5 of Block 3 of theOaklandAddition
(generallylocated on Moore Avenue eastof Bynum Street)and the vacatedalley
betweenFrank Avenue and Moore Avenue extending from Bynum to Bledsoe
Streetbe approved on First Readingas presented. The following vote was
recorded:

Aye: Mayor Bronaugh,CouncilmembersBoyd, and Bowman
Nay: CouncilmembersSimond,Jones,Gordenand Weems

Motion failed with a 4 to 3 vote.

6. ORDINANCE - APPROVED - SECOND READING - CLOSURE OF ALLEY - CAIN
STREET

Mayor Bronaughstatedthatthenext item for considerationwasSecondReadingof
an Ordinancefor theclosureof an alley on CainStreet.

Motion wasmadeby CouncilmemberDon Boyd andsecondedby Councilmember
PercySimond thatOrdinancefor theclosureof an alley on CainStreetbe approved
on Secondand Final Readingas presented. A unanimousaffirmative vote was
recorded.

7. ORDINANCE - APPROVED - FIRST READING - ZONE CHANGE

-

RESIDENTIAL LARGE SINGLE FAMILY TO RESTRICTIVE PROFESSIONAL
OFFICE - SPECIAL USE PERMIT - MOTOR BANK - S. JOHN REDDITT DRIVE
(LOOP 287)AND COPELAND STREET - R. H. DUNCAN - A. B. JORDAN

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat thenext item for considerationwas the requestof R. H.
Duncanand A. B. Jordanto changethe zoning from “RL” ResidentialLargeSingle
Family to “RPO” Restrictive ProfessionalOffice and approval of a SpecialUse
Permit for a motor bank on property located at the northwest corner of the
intersectionof S. JohnReddittDrive (Loop 287) andCopelandStreet.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat included in the Council packetis the memo of
explanation from the Planning Department along with a unanimous
recommendationfor approvalof the zonechangewith onecondition that the site
plan approval is required prior to the issuanceof a building permit and the
approvedsite plan will be madea part of the Ordinancegrantingthe SpecialUse
Permit.

Motion was made by CouncilmemberTucker Weems and secondedby
CouncilmemberPercy Simond that Ordinanceto changethe zoning from “RL”
Residential Large Single Family to “RPO” Restrictive ProfessionalOffice and
approval of a Special Use Permit for a motor bank on property located at the
northwest corner of the intersectionof S. John Redditt Drive (Loop 287) and
CopelandStreetbe approvedon First Readingwith the condition that the site plan
approvalis requiredprior to the issuanceof abuilding permitand theapprovedsite
plan will be madea part of the Ordinancegranting the SpecialUse Permit. A
unanimousaffirmative vote wasrecorded.
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8. ORDINANCE - APPROVED - FIRST READING - ZONE CHANGE

-

RESIDENTIAL SMALL SINGLE FAMILY TO LOCAL BUSINESS - OAKWOOD
ADDITION - CHESTNUT AND RALPH STREETS - KEITH GREEN - SANDRA
KID WELL

Mayor Bronaughstatedthatthenext item for considerationwas therequestof Keith
Greenon behalf of SandraKidwell to changethe zoning from “RS” Residential
Small Single Family to “LB’ Local Businesson Lot 8, Block 2 of the Oakwood
Addition generallylocated at the southeastcornerof the intersectionof Chestnut
andRalph Streets.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat included in the Council packetis a memorandum
of explanationfrom thePlanningDepartment anda recommendationof approval
by thePlanning& ZoningCommission.

Motion wasmadeby CouncilmemberDon Boyd andsecondedby Councilmember
JackGorden,Jr. that Ordinanceto changethe zoningfrom “RS” ResidentialSmall
SingleFamily to “LB” Local Businesson Lot 8, Block 2 of the OakwoodAddition
generallylocatedat thesoutheastcornerof the intersectionof Chestnutand Ralph
Streetsbe approvedon First Readingaspresented. A unanimousaffirmative vote
wasrecorded.

9. AMENDMENT - APPROVED - FIRST READING - SKATEBOARD ORDINANCE

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat thenext item for considerationwasan Amendmentto

theSkateboardOrdinance.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat includedin the Council packetaresomelettersof
requestfrom NationsBankandvariousoccupantswithin the NationsBankfacility.
City ManagerMaclin statedthatbasicallythey arerequestingCouncil consideration
for theextensionof theboundaryline for enforcementof theSkateboardOrdinance
that was approvedfor downtownseveralmonthsago to include thepropertythat
includestheNationsBankfacility. City ManagerMaclin statedthat the current
property border is about one block north of their property and they are just
requestingthat it comedownanotherblock to includetheirproperty.

Jim Peters,property representativefor the owners of the building commonly
referredto as the NationsBankbuilding, statedthat the tenantshavean excelarating
problemwith youngstersusing thepropertyfor skateboardareasandfor line skating
creatinga hazardboth to themselvesandto theclients andemployeesthatfrequent
the building and property. Mr. Petersstatedthat recently the youngstershave
startedcoming into thebuilding on the skateboardsprimarily to usethe restroom
andthewaterfountainfacilities. Mr. Petersstatedthat he hasno quarrelwith the
youngstersother than the fact that they have now started to disregardthe
cleanlinessand the safetyof the property inside. Mr. Petersstatedthat thereare
occasionswherecustomersand clients in the building were told to getout of the
way and told using profanity which is not conduciveto a businessatmosphere.
Mr. Petersstatedthat the owners acquiredthis property with the intention of
restoringit to its original quality andmakeit a showplacefor the City of Lufkin.
Mr. Petersstatedthatthe renovationprocesshasbegun. Mr. Petersstatedthat he is
askingthattheOrdinancebe extendedoneblock to includethebanknotonly for the
safetyof the childrenand customersbut also to relievethepossibility of financial
liability on the part of the ownersshouldoneof them havean accidentor causean
accident. Mr. Petersstatedthatbasedon thisheis respectfullyrequestingthatthe
Ordinancebe extendedoneblock.

CouncilmemberSimond askedwhy the Ordinancecould not be extendedto
DenmanAvenue. City ManagerMaclin statedthat Mr. Petersis askingthat the
Ordinancebeextendedto JodieStreet.
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Mr. Petersstatedthathe is not askingfor assistanceinsidethebuilding. Mr. Peters
statedthatOrdinanceNo. 3217coversthedowntownareaandcomesadjacentto this
propertyandheis askingthatit beextendedto theendof thatblock to give themthe
protectionthatCouncil hasalreadyaffordedthebalanceof thedowntownarea.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberJones,Mr. Petersstatedthat the only
measuresthat they are ableto take that areavailableto them legally, morally and
ethically areto justask thepeoplenot to comein betweenthecars,andpleasedo not
comeinto thebuilding andsoil the restrooms. Mr. Petersstatedthatheknowsthat
as a property ownerhe has a liability financially to the skateboardersand to the
automobileownerson thepremises. Mr. Petersstatedthathis attorneyssay thathe
alsohasliability in.theevent a skateboardruns into a carparkedin theparking lot.
Mr. Petersstatedthat thishasalreadyhappenedand thepersonthat this happened
to was nice enoughto say that they would tend to the damage repair on their
automobile.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberGorden,Mr. Petersstatedthat the legal
ownerof recordof thepropertyis S & B Corporationof Dallas.

CouncilmemberGorden statedthat dependingon what happenson this item
tonight he would offer a motion that Council rescind the existing Skateboard
Ordinance. CouncilmemberGordenstatedthat, in his opinion, theCity is not in a
position to regulatethis type of activity. CouncilmemberGordenstatedthat he
wantedto go on record as sayingthat he is against Council having approvedthe
SkateboardOrdinance.

CouncilmemberSimond statedthat when the SkateboardOrdinancewas first
consideredhetoowasopposedto it but hehashada changeof heartespeciallysince
Mr. Petershad addressedthe liability issue. CouncilmemberSimond that he did
not like theideaof amendingtheOrdinanceoneblockat a time.

Mr. Petersstatedthatthe citizenryof Lufkin doeshavethefeelingof beingprotected
from various hazards,one of them being the children on skateboardsrunning in
betweenthe cars,up and down the sidewalkscreatinga hazardas far as people
walking. Mr. Petersstatedthatin additionto that thebanknow hasemployeesin
thebuilding that area little hesitantaboutgoing homein theeveningespeciallyif
they work latebecauseof thegroupor crowdthat aresomewhatintimidating (notin
wordsor actions)in size. Mr. Petersstatedthatbankemployeesarenow askingfor
anescortto their carsif theywork lateor work on Saturdays. Mr. Petersstatedthat
thebank feels that this is not conduciveto good businessand it wasnot their intent
to buy into ablightedarea,andtheirpositionis thattheywill restorethebankinside
andoutsidethattheCity of Lufkin will beproudof astheywerein thebeginning.

CouncilmemberBowmanstatedthat he concurredwith Mr. Simondin that it does
not makesenseto extendtheOrdinanceoneblockat a time.

In responseto questionby Mr. Peters,City ManagerMaclin statedthat the original
intent of this Ordinancegoesback to the Main StreetAdvisory Committeewho
recommendedthis Ordinanceto the City Council predicatedon the need and
circumstancesof downtownwith narrow sidewalksand the problemsthat were
being encounteredby certain businessesin the downtownarea. City Manager
Maclin statedthattheboundariesreferbackto the CentralBusinessDistrict which is
a commonlyrecognizeddefinableareaof downtown. City ManagerMacInstated
thatwas theeasiest,mostlogical boundaryfor utilization of enforcement.

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat, in his opinion, it is theCity’s responsibilityto make
thesidewalkssafeinside theCity limits. CouncilmemberBowmanaskedthat a map
of theCentralFireDistrict be includedin theCouncilpacketinformationfor Second
Readingof this Amendment.

CouncilmemberBoyd statedthat he could empathizewith the bank, but the City
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needsto build a skatepark for the kids or provide someplace for them to go.
CouncilmemberBoyd statedthat the kids are our future. Mayor Bronaughstated
that Council could have a workshop and discussthe liability and insurance
requirementsrelatingto a skateboardpark.

Motion wasmadeby CouncilmemberBetty Jones andsecondedby Councilmember
Bob Bowmanthat Amendmentto the SkateboardOrdinancebe approvedon First
Readingaspresented. Thefollowing votewasrecorded:

Aye: CouncilmembersJones,Bowman,Simond,Weems,Mayor Bronaugh
Nay: CouncilmembersGordenandBoyd

Motion,carriedwith a 5 to 2 vote.

10. AGREEMENT - APPROVED - HUMANE SOCIETY OF ANGELINA
COUNTY/CITY OF LUFKIN - ANIMAL ADOPTION

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas an Agreement
betweenthe City of Lufkin and the HumaneSocietyof Angelina County for the
adoptionof animals.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat included in the Council packetis a cover letter
followed by a joint agreementbetweenthe Angelina County HumaneSocietyand
theCity of Lufkin for a cooperativeprogramregardingthe adoptionof animalsin
the City of Lufkin. City ManagerMaclin statedthat this would provide a joint
cooperativeagreementas previouslydiscussedin Januaryaboutthe initiation of an
adoptionprogram. City ManagerMaclin statedthatafterfurther discussionwith the
HumaneSociety of AngelinaCounty theyhad come up with a methodologythat
would provide an opportunity for more animalsto be adopted,more animalsfor
selection for the citizen, and will provide a clear delineationof responsibilities
betweenthe City and theHumaneSociety in this activity. City ManagerMaclin
statedthat it is the staff recommendationto approve this cooperativeagreement
betweentheCity andtheAngelinaCountyHumaneSociety.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberBoyd, City ManagerMaclin statedthat
this agreementprovides a cooperativeagreementbetweenthe two agencies,the
other agreementwould havebeentwo separateadoptionprograms,one through
theHumaneSocietyandonethroughthe City. City ManagerMaclin statedthatthis
agreementwill provide a written documentthat will hold eachentity accountable
for their actions.

Motion was made by Councilmember Bob Bowman and seconded by
CouncilmemberJackGorden,Jr. that theAgreementbetweentheCity of Lufkin and
theHumaneSocietyof AngelinaCounty for theadoptionof animalsbe approvedas
presented. A unanimousaffirmativevote wasrecorded.

11. SCHEDULE OF ACTIVITIES - APPROVED - ISSUANCEOF DEBT - CAPITAL
IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas a scheduleof
activitiesrelatingto issuanceof debtfor capital improvementprojects.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat at a called meetingwith Council last month there
was discussionof severalitems for capital improvementprojectsto be forthcoming.
City ManagerMaclin statedthat Council had given preliminary approvalto those
items and basicallywhat staff wantedto do tonightwas to provideCouncil with a
scheduleof sequencedactivities relating to the regionaldetentionponds. City
ManagerMaclin statedthatthereis alsoa draft of theplansfor the new Solid Waste
Facility andthenew FireStation. City ManagerMaclin statedthattheseplanswill
be broughtbackto Council on April 7th for formal considerationof approval. City
ManagerMacunstatedthatwhat staff specificallywantedto seekCouncil’s approval
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on tonightwas the memorandumfrom the City Engineerthatprovidesa sequence
of eventsfor developingtheseproposedregionaldetentionponds.

Keith Wright statedthat in order to move forward there areseveralitems for the
proposedbonds,theregionaldetentionfacilities off of Old Union Road andLotus
Lane. Mr. Wright statedthat the first stepin developingthis projectwould be to
enterinto an engineeringcontract, andstaff is proposingto do that with Klotz &
Associates,EGA, andPickett & Jacobsto coverall aspectsof theengineering. Mr.
Wright statedthat the secondstepwould be to approachthepropertyownersand
beginproperty acquisitioncostestimatesand appraisals. Mr. Wright statedthat
oneof thebestwaysto approachthevarioustypesof tractstheyaredealingwith is to
meetwith JakeLyons andSid Medford, andbeginthe surveyingand acquisition
process. Mr. Wright stated that next they would do the actual designof the
spillway and the flood routing of the 100 year storm through the facility. Mr.
Wright statedthat they would completegeotechnicalinvestigationsto determine
thesoil typesfor thedamthatwould be constructedandwhat type of borrowareas
they couldprovide dirt from in theproposedfacility. Mr. Wright statedthat they
would do a detailedtopographicsurveyof thedamareasto determinetheexactsize
and location of the dams. Mr. Wright stated that they would develop an
environmentalimpact and get wetlandsapproval from the U. S. Army Corps of
Engineersandapprovalfrom theTNRCC dueto thedamheights, andadambreak
safetyanalysisto determineif the damfailed what kind of problemstherewould be
down stream. Mr. Wright statedthat the next stepwould be to do the actual
design,preparetheplansand specificationsfor the dam andthe spillway and the
low level outlet, then moveon to completeconstruction. Mr. Wright statedthat
this is a brief outline and staff wasrequestingCouncil approvalto move forward
with this project. Mr. Wright statedthat Klotz & Associates,who were hired to
review the flood study, listed 31 different commentson the study, andthere is a
responsefrom Dotson& Associateson thosecomments. Mr. Wright statedthat
staff expectsvery little changein the document itself from thesecomments. Mr.
Wright statedthatstaff would like to moveforward in submittingthis to FEMA and
with PublicHearingsat City Hall for thepublic to haveinputinto theprocess.

City ManagerMaclin statedthatbasicallywhat staff is seekingfrom Council tonight
is to grant staff permissionto pursuethe schedule of activities including the
submittalto FEMA andthePublic Hearingsprocessto allow for public, andat the
next Council meeting staff will ask for formal approval of the plans and
specificationsfor the two facilities - theSolid WasteFacility andtheFire Substation
so that oncethoseareapprovedstaff can go out to bid on thoseitems also. Mr.
Wright statedthat staff would alsolike to go aheadandenter into the engineering
contracts,and startdevelopingthepropertyacquisitionfor thedetentionponds.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberBowman,Mr. Wright statedthatthecost
estimateis $1.8million, andthe timeestimatewill probablytakecloseto eight to ten
monthsto finish theproject,dependingon propertyacquisition.

Motion was made by Councilmember Jack Gorden, Jr. and secondedby
CouncilmemberBob Bowmanthat scheduleof activitiesrelatingto the issuanceof
debt for capital improvementprojectsbe approvedas presented. A unanimous
affirmative votewasrecorded.

12. REPLACEMENTOF ASBESTOS/CEMENTPIPELINES

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas replacementof

asbestos/cementpipelines.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat this is also an item that wasdiscussedat thecalled
meetingin February,and it was agreedat that time that Council would delay any
further actionfor 30 daysto allow Council theopportunityfor public input. City
ManagerMaclin statedthatstaff hadindicatedthattheywould askMr. Byrd to come
back after further review of the Texas Water Developmentlow interest loan
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programfor water quality programsand to submit to Council a proposeddebt
amortization dividing the estimated$15 million project into five $3 million
installments. City ManagerMaclin statedthat 25% of the City’s distribution system
is madeup of asbestospipe andwould be divided into blocksof approximatelythat
size for bidding and constructionpurposes. City ManagerMaclin statedthat we
would alsothenbe ableto stagger the increasein ratesto makeit moreaffordable
for thecitizens.City ManagerMaclin statedthat by breakingit up into smallerbites
in a lessthan3% rate increaseperyear range it would be easierto budgetfrom a
consumersstandpoint.

Mike Byrd, the City’s financial advisor, statedthat he passedout a one page
illustration of theamortizationscheduleon five $3 million issues. Mr. Byrd stated
that if the City needs to put $15 million in thebank to do this project as soonas
possible,thatis fine. Mr. Byrd statedthathewould thengo to marketandtry to get
thebestdealthereis. Mr. Byrd statedthatthe reasonhe proposedinstallmentswas
that in visiting with theCity Engineer the logisticsof theproject arethat it simply
cannotbedonewithin a coupleof years,andif thatis thecase,he would like to see
the City, to theextentthat it can, take advantageof the arbitragelaws. Mr. Byrd
statedthat if theCity issues$5 million or lessof taxexemptdebt in a calendaryear,
thenthey are entitled to invest the moneyand keepany differencethat they make
over and abovethe costof thebonds. Mr. Byrd statedthat under the Drinking
WaterStateRevolvingFund the interestrateswould be somewherebetween3 1/2
to 4%, andif that is thecase,themoneycouldbe investedfor a coupleof yearsat 5 to
5 1/2%. Mr. Byrd statedthattheneedfor thecapitalandtheproject time line is the
main consideration. Mr. Byrd statedthatthis is a very basicillustration showingin
the left handcolumnthe total currentwaterandsewerpayments,plus the $200,000
that hasbeenincludedin the $4.4 million issue,andfive installmentsof $3 million.
Mr. Byrd statedthat readingfrom left to right to theProjectedTotal Water& Sewer
Paymentsin 1998, the total obligationsof the City’s water and sewer systemis
$1,764,169. Mr. Byrd statedthat the column to the right shows the additional
paymentthat is requiredover the baseyear,1998 being thebaseyear. Mr. Byrd
statedthatthis is expressedin terms of apercentageincreasethat would berequired
over and abovethebaseyear revenues. Mr. Byrd statedthat in looking at the
example,in the year 2005, the City would needan increaseof $624,897more to
servicedebtservice. Mr. Byrd statedthatthe actual increasein revenuesover this
five year period of time should fall somewhereclose to 4 or 5% becausethis
illustrationfails to takeinto accountnormalgrowth andrevenuesfrom year to year.
Mr. Byrd statedthat whenhe speaksin termsof budgetincreases,he would notbe
referringto the increaseasthe 1998year,butwould look at prior year revenuesand
seehow muchthe City needs. Mr. Byrd statedthat Lufkin hasbeenin a healthy
growth patternandhe is not awareof any reasonthat we shouldexpectany major
changesthere. Mr. Byrd statedthat if the Council finds that as the projected
paymentsreachthe$2.3/$2.4million rangethey will feel a little more comfortable
with some smaller payments, he can customizethe scheduleand keep the total
paymentaround$2.2 million. Mr. Byrd statedthat in order to do so he would
ship a smallamountof theprincipalout to lateryears.Mr. Byrd statedthatto do this
m installmentsallows theCouncil flexibility to look from year to year andtakeinto
accounthow thingsareandmakeadjustmentsaccordingly. Mr. Byrd statedthat
basedon 1998 revenuesanda moderateamountof growththeCity shouldbe able
to accommodate$15 million with abouta 5% increaseover time.

CouncilmemberGordenstatedthat he would like to seetheCity usearbitragebut
askedif therewas somethingthatwould interferewith that if theCouncil makesa
commitmentto do the total projectandissuethebondson an asneededbasisandif
it becomesnecessaryto do theprojectbeforea calendaryearexpireswhichwould go
againstthe arbitrage,couldwe do it anyway. Mr. Byrd statedthat he askedthe
questionof bond counseltheotherday thatif theCity goesforward whenwe do a
bond issuewith a reasonableexpectationthat thingsaregoing to be a certainway,
and at suchtime that theCity issues,if we do not expectthat we will issuemore
than $5 million in a calendaryear, then as soon as we get the proceedswe
commencewith arbitrageif we canmakeit. CouncilmemberGordenstatedthathe
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still believesthat theCity shoulddo thewholeprojectat onetime. Mr. Byrd stated
that basedon the informationhe is getting, the logistics of theprojectmay be such
that it requiresa multi-year constructionperiodandevenat that it could be funded
at onetime, which would be at the Council’s pleasure. Mr. Byrd statedthat if the
City thought that they couldn~t actually accomplishthe constructionin a two to
threeyear time andwent aheadandissuedtheentire$15million, we wouldnot get
any effectof the arbitrage. Mr. Byrd statedthathe did not want to overemphasize
this but the arbitrageis not theover riding consideration. CouncilmemberGorden
statedthat the other sideof the coin is that Council will look into the economiesof
scalebecauseit is a hugejob, but it needsdoing andthe Council is committedto
gettingit done.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat the otherrelationshipto that is the TNRCC, if the
City hasmoretestsabove7 million fibers perliter betweennow andthe endof this
calendar year, TNRCC may require the City to move at an acceleratedrate.
CouncilmemberGordenstatedthat the Council’s commitment to get this project
doneandfind away to getit doneall atonetime is theoretical,but it couldsavethe
City a lot of moneyin finesthatwould over ride thearbitrage. Mr. Byrd statedthat
a recommendationthat couldbe in order for theCouncil todayis to authorizesome
engineeringto find out exactlywhat we are dealingwith. Mr. Byrd staedthat
Council canreimburseitself if they chooseto from theproceedsof thatfuture issue.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberSimond,Mr. Wright statedthat on the
estimatesbasicallywhatstaff did wasto take 1,000feetof pipeandlook at thecostof
that assumingthat therewould be two watervalves,so manyconnections,so much
acquisitions,andthe assumptionwasmadebasedon the total footageof pipe. Mr.
Wright statedthatthereneedsto be a real detailedestimatethat will takenumerous
manhoursto develop,andtheCity will needto hire someengineersto do that all
overtheCity.

City ManagerMaclin statedthatultimately whatevertheCouncil decidestonightas
a plan, that plan will be put into writing andstaff will submit it to TNRCC andhe
andMr. Wrightwill go to Austin andvisit with themandtry to getthemto agreeto
the plan that is agreeduponby this Council in hopesthat theywill endorseit and
approveit asanacceptablemeansof resolvingtheproblem. Mr. Wright statedthat
theCity of Lufkin enteredabilateralagreementwith TNRCC andin that agreement
the City promisedto them that if we continuedto haveviolations that we would
takeadditionalsteps,andtheonly additionalstepsat this point is to replacethepipe.

City ManagerMaclin statedthathe would suggestfrom astaff standpointthatunder
thepresumptionthat Council feelssimilar to Mr. Gordenin that we do needto get
rid of this problemandthe only way to get rid of theproblem is to get rid of the
pipe, to authorizestaff to move forward with RFP’s (requestfor proposalsfrom
engineeringfirms) to assist staff in the cost estimateand identification of these
projectsthat would basically replace250/o of theCity’s distribution systemthat is
currentlyasbestoscementpipe. City managerMacIn statedthatwith theassistance
of Mr. Esquivel,theCity’s bond counsel/legalprovider,with a Resolutionwhereif
the City usesit’s Utility Fund fund balancecurrently until suchtime as we get
proceedsfrom the TexasWaterDevelopmentBoard’s low interestprogram,thenwe
could use existing funds on hand to pay for those costs and then reimburse
ourselvesas soon as the bond proceedsare made available,which would be
sometimesthis fall. City ManagerMaclin statedthatstaffwould makeapplication
for the low interestloan fundsunder the assumptionthat the City would receive
them, and oncewe hadfundson handwe could beginconstruction. City Manager
Maclin statedthatby giving staff theauthorizationto moveforward with this now
it allows us to work with engineeringfirms to getthepreliminarywork completed
sothatwhenwe do havecashon handwe cango to bid immediately.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberWeems,City ManagerMaclin statedthat
if we receivea failure notification thenstaffwould seekMr. Byrd’s assistanceto go
to the generalmarketandsell revenuebondsat a higherrateof interest.
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Motion was made by CouncilmemberTucker Weems and secondedby
Councilmember Percy Simondauthorizing staff to do the engineeringstudy to
develop the cost for the replacementof the asbestos/cementpipe lines. A
unanimousaffirmative vote wasrecorded.

13. AUTHORIZATION TO SEEK BIDS - APPROVED - REPLACING PAVILION -

CHAMBERS PARK - INSURANCE LOSS FUND

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat thenext item for considerationwas authorizationto
seekbids for replacing the pavilion at ChambersPark with funding from the
InsuranceLossFund.

City Manager Maclin stated that during a recent storm a large pine tree fell
destroyingthe pavilion which hadbeenin the park for a numberof years. City
Manager Maclin stated that included in the Council packet is a letter of
recommendationfrom theParksandLeisureServicesDepartment. City Manager
Maclin statedthat DennisRobertson,the Chairmanof the ParksAdvisory Board,
and Mike Sandlinof the ParksDepartmentareboth presentshouldCouncil have
any questions. City ManagerMaclin statedthat the recommendationis that the
pavilionbe replacedat an estimatedcostof approximately$24,000. City Manager
Maclin statedthatthis item would go to bid. City ManagerMaclin statedthatstaff’s
suggestionto Council is that therearetwo options, theGeneralFund contingency,
or the InsuranceLossFund. Thereis $200,000in theGeneralFundcontingencyat
this time.

Motion was made by Councilmember Bob Bowman and secondedby
CouncilmemberBetty Jones that staff be authorizedto seekbids for replacingthe
pavilion at ChambersParkwith funding from theGeneralFundContingencyFund.
A unanimousaffirmative vote wasrecorded.

14. BIDS - APPROVED - STREET IMPROVEMENTS - WEBBER STREET

Mayor Bronaughstatedthat the next item for considerationwas bids for street

improvementsto WebberStreet.

City ManagerMaclin statedthat this is theproject that was initiated with a grant
applicationto the Texas Capital Fund followed by an exceedingmatchinggrant
applicationto theEconomicDevelopmentAdministration,andwas triggeredby the
creationof jobsat Pilgrim’s Pridepoultry processingfacility locatedat the cornerof
FrankandWebber. City ManagerMaclin statedthat thebid openingwasheld this
pastFriday afternoon. City ManagerMaclin statedthat copiesof theengineering
firm project directorsletter of recommendation,alongwith thebid tabulationfrom
the four companieswho providedbids, was faxedto Councilmembersprior to this
meeting.

Philip Goodwinstatedthatbids were receivedon March13th at 2:00 p.m., andthe
low bid for all pavementoptions was from Timberline ConstructionCompany.
Their bid for Option 1, which wasreinforcedconcretepavementwas$970,693. The
bid for Option 2 was$919,362, which was for asphalticpavementwith a limestone
base. There were alternatebids for using a fly ashmixture for the reinforced
concretein the amountof $968,533. Mr. Goodwin statedthat the bids werevery
closein theconcreteoption andthe asphalticoption. Mr. Goodwinstatedthatthe
spreadis quite a bit lessthanwhat thegeneralspreadis betweenasphalticconcrete
andreinforcedconcrete. Mr. Goodwinstatedthat when thespreadis this closethe
engineerstake into considerationthe use of the pavement,and in this casethe
pavementwill be usedfor an industrial area,with a lot of heavywheel load to
includea concreteplant, anasphaltplant, aCocaColaplant andapoultry plant that
will havequite a bit of truck traffic on it. Mr. Goodwinstatedthat therearealso
some geometricconsiderations, which includes an “5” curve at the Coca Cola
locationwhich will makesomelateralstresson thepavement.Mr. Goodwinstated
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that in making this recommendationthey havelookedat the initial costversusthe
long term cost. Mr. Goodwinstatedthat reinforcedconcretepavement,while it
costsmoreon the front end, is considerablyless costto theCity in themaintenance
of thepavementover the life of the street. Mr. Goodwin statedthat reinforced
concretepavementwill last for 40 yearswith relativelyminimal maintenanceand
asphalticconcretepavementusually requiresrefurbishingata periodof 8 to 10 years
andthenarepeatrefurbishingin another8 to 10 years. Mr. Goodwinstatedthatall
things considered,in consideringthe close dollar price of the bid, they are
recommendingthatCouncil go with Option 1, thereinforcedconcretebid.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberBowman, Mr. Goodwin statedthat the
asphalticsectionis ~ ratherdetailedsectionbecauseof thewheelloads,it startswith
a subgradeof a lime stabilizedbase of 6”, andon top of thatis 9 1/2” of limestone
base,which is the best base they can get under an asphalticpavement. Mr.
Goodwinstatedthatthenthereis a2 1/2” surfaceof hot mix asphalton top of that.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberBoyd, Mr. Goodwin statedthat he is
recommendingconcretefor this streetbecauseof the loadsandthe relatively small
amountof additionalcostit would takeon the front endof the reinforcedconcrete.
CouncilmemberBoyd statedthat on the MLK bid the engineersrecommended
asphaltand it is just as heavy a load becausethereareheavytrucks on MLK too.
CouncilmemberBoyd askedwhat was the differencebetweenMLK and Webber
Street. City ManagerMaclin statedthat for thebenefitof Mr. Goodwin,he wasnot
the engineeron the MLK project. City ManagerMaclin statedthatthe difference
betweentheasphaltandconcretebids on MEK wasover40%, andthedifferencein
this case is only 5%, which makes a major contribution on why he would
recommendOption 1. CouncilmemberBoyd statedthat all of a suddenconcretegot
real cheap. City ManagerMaclin statedthatthe only personwho could explain
thepricesin thematerialswouldbe MooreBros.

In responseto questionby CouncilmemberBoyd, City ManagerMaclin statedthat
the reasonthecontractorshad dug so deepon MLK was to put all thebasematerial
necessaryfor thepavementto hold up. Mr. Wright statedthat oneof the reasons
the contractorsdug so deepis for sightingdistancesfor traffic coming up over the
hill for safetypurposes,and for drainage.

Motion was made by Councilmember Tucker Weems and secondedby
CouncilmemberJackGorden,Jr. thatbid of TimberlineConstructionCompany in
the amountof $970,693 for Option 1 as recommendedby staff be approvedas
submitted. Thefollowing votewas recorded:

Aye: CouncilmembersWeems,Gorden,Simond, andMayor Bronaugh

Nay: CouncilmembersBowmanandBoyd

Motion carriedwith a4 to 2 vote.

15. COMMENTS

Mayor Bronaughreminded Councilmembersof the DETCOG meeting in San

JacintoCountyon the26th.

16. There beingno further businessfor

p.m.

Louis A. Bronaugh
Mayor

Atha Stokes- City Secretary
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